
 

  

 
 
 
   

Program Guide  
Week 41                                

        

 
Sunday October 2nd, 2016 

      
5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 

(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   
 
5:20 am Football 2016: FIFA Futsal World Cup Final - Coverage of the FIFA Futsal World Cup 

Final. Watch as Australia's Futsalroos in action as they compete agains the world's best 
teams. Teams TBC. (From Colombia) (Football/Soccer)   

 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Premier League: Swansea V Liverpool LIVE - SBS football reporter Lucy Zelic and SBS 

football analyst and former Crystal Palace player Craig Foster host live coverage as 
Swansea take on Liverpool. (Sport) (Football/Soccer)   

 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Rise Of The Machines - Super Airship - Stunning CGI animation explodes open a 

revolutionary new breed of airship, the Aeros Dragon Dream, to reveal the technology that 
it depends on during a series of gruelling flight tests. In Tustin Airbase, California, Dragon 
Dream takes off for the first time. If the test flight is successful, it will demonstrate Dragon 
Dream’s radical new design works and will open a new chapter in aviation history. Failure 
will consign his vision to the scrapheap. (From the UK) (Documentary) G CC   

 
2:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
4:00 pm FIFA World Cup 2018 Magazine - This magazine program reports on Russia's 

preparations for the 2018 FIFA World Cup, including details of venues and regions, along 
with a look at football in Russia in general. (Football) CC   

 
4:30 pm Cycling: Voxwomen - The Voxwomen Cycling Show is an all-new cycling show created 

exclusively by women that puts female riders in the spotlight, with racing news, tips & 
behind the scenes insight. (Sport) (Cycling) CC     
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5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - In this episode we check out the small businesses making a 

huge impact on social economic issues. We visit Melbourne social enterprise Pollinate 
Energy, who are lighting up Indian slums with solar lighting, and fly to Hong Kong to drop 
in on Les Beatitudes, the stay-at-home mums making purses out of neckties to support 
their family. We head to Brisbane to auto repair shop Brothers Garage, who train up at-
risk youth, asylum seekers and the disabled, and visit Dick Smith in his Sydney home to 
gain his business insight. We also explore the young Australians fighting the global water 
crisis, and check out a warehouse employing those from disadvantaged backgrounds to 
recycle mattresses from landfills. (S.1 Ep.10) (SBS Production) (Documentary Series) 
(Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   

 
5:30 pm Nazi Megastructures - Super Tanks - Hitler’s megalomaniac impulses led him to 

demand the construction of the largest tank the world had ever seen a mobile fortress 
weighing 180 tonnes. But even this colossus couldn’t satisfy Hitler’s thirst for enormous 
weapons of war, as he went on to request a land battleship weighing 1,000 tons. This is 
the story of the Nazi engineers tasked with fulfilling that dream, and an arms race that 
resulted in the evolution of super-guns and tanks. (Part 4 of 6) (From the US) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Treasures Of Ancient Greece - The Age of Heroes - Arts journalist Alastair Sooke 

explores the riches and unique legacy of Greek art in this new three-part series. In the first 
episode, Alastair investigates the surprising roots of Greek art, beginning his journey in 
Crete at the palace of Knossos, legendary home of the Minotaur. He travels to Santorini to 
the 'Greek Pompeii', and finds gold in the fabled stronghold of Mycenae and dazzling 
remains from Greece's Dark Ages. Alastair discovers the beginnings of a defining spirit in 
Greek art, embracing mythology, a passion for symmetry, and an obsession with the 
human body. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Part 1 of 3) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
8:35 pm Earth From Space - Earth from Space takes you on an epic quest to discover the 

invisible forces and processes that sustain life on our planet and, for the first time, see 
them in action in their natural environment in vivid detail. These truly unique images will 
explore the deepest mysteries of its existence, raising profound questions and challenging 
the old assumptions of how Earth's system works. (From the US) (Documentary) (Rpt) G 
CC   

 
10:20 pm The Amina Profile - Part love story, part international thriller, and a gripping chronicle of 

an unprecedented media and sociological hoax, this feature documentary travels from 
San Francisco and Washington to Istanbul, Tel Aviv and Beirut in a quest to reveal the 
true identity of the person behind the popular blog A Gay Girl in Damascus. Who is this 
Syrian-American revolutionary who goes by the name of Amina Arraf? Not even 
Montrealer Sandra Bagaria, with whom Amina is carrying an online affair, seems to know 
for sure. As the Syrian uprising gains momentum, the blog attracts a huge following. But 
it’s Amina’s subsequent abduction that sparks an international outcry to free her. Telling a 
detective story that involves various intelligence agencies and top-tier global media, the 
film tells a thoroughly modern tale of technology, love and news-as-spectacle questions 
the ways in which people connect in today’s virtual world. (From Canada, in English, 
French & Arabic) (Documentary) (Class. tba) CC **Premiere** 

 
 
 



SBS Program Guide – Week 41 (2016) 

 

 

Sunday October 2nd, 2016 
 
 MOVIE: 
11:20 pm Louise-Michel - In this radical and endearing black comedy, a group of retrenched female 

factory workers decide to pool their compensation money… and hire a hit man to liquidate 
their boss. Winner of the Special Jury Prize World Cinema at the 2009 Sundance Film 
Festival. Directed by Gustave de Kervern and Benoît Delépine, and stars Yolande 
Moreau, Bouli Lanners and Benoît Poelvoorde. (From France, in French) (Comedy) 
(2008) (Rpt) M (L,V) CC  

 
MOVIE: 

1:05 am Ten Winters - Born of a chance meeting on a ferry in Venice, Silvestro and Camilla's 
rocky romance unfolds over ten winters as new lovers come and go, but they are eternally 
thrust back into one another's arms. Winner of the 2010 David di Donatello Award for Best 
New Director. Directed by Valerio Mieli and stars Isabella Ragonese, Michele Riondino 
and Glen Blackhall. (From Italy, in Italian, Russian and English) (Romance) (2009) (Rpt) 
M(S,L)   

 
2:50 am Life On Us - Our health, body shape, mood and even our evolution are determined by the 

unseen life forms that swarm throughout our bodies. This programme looks at the 
battleground within our bodies and the remarkable new science that is changing our views 
about health and disease. We take our audience on a safari full of surprises to discover 
the role that microbes and worms play in our everyday life and the way they’ve shaped us 
throughout our evolution. As the series concludes, we realise that the key to our existence 
is in maintaining the delicate balance between ourselves and all the other species that 
we’ve evolved with – both inside and out. We will never again look at our bodies in the 
same way. (Part 2 of 2) (Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
3:55 am Ebola - The Search For A Cure - The current Ebola epidemic in West Africa is the worst 

outbreak of the fatal disease in history, with the World Health Organization reporting more 
than 5,800 cases, including more than 3,000 deaths in the current outbreak. The Centers 
for Disease Control and Prevention also assumes that the actual number of cases is 2.5 
times higher than what is officially known and have also predicted 1.4-million infections in 
those countries by January 20 if no action is taken to curb the epidemic in West Africa. In 
this documentary premiere, meet the scientists and doctors from all around the world 
looking for the cure and hear first-hand accounts of what it's actually like to catch - and 
survive - this terrible disease. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Al Jazeera News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in English.   
 
2:00 pm Eros Ramazzotti Cinecetta Concert - Shot at the historic and prestigious movie studios 

of Cinecittà (from the Hollywood golden age masterpieces to Gangs of New York), on 
location with ancient Rome props and surrounded by fans from all over the world, Eros 
Ramazzotti returned to his origins, the very neighbourhood he was born 50 years ago and 
grew up in, to present his new album NOI and some of his best hits. (From Italy, in Italian) 
(Entertainment) (Rpt) G    

 
3:30 pm Cuba With Simon Reeve - Two years since Cuba announced the most sweeping and 

radical economic reforms the country has seen in decades, Simon Reeve heads to the 
Caribbean island to look at how economic liberalisation is taking hold of communist Cuba. 
From ending state rationing to cutting one million public-sector jobs, one of the last 
communist bastions in the world has begun rolling back the state on an unprecedented 
scale. Simon meets ordinary Cubans whose lives are being transformed. (From the UK, in 
English and Spanish) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   
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4:30 pm Wild West With Ray Mears - Mountains - Internationally renowned bushcraft expert and 

survivalist, Ray Mears, explores how the awe-inspiring landscape of North America 
shaped the story of the Wild West. As Ray travels through each landscape, he discovers 
how extraordinary topography, extreme weather, wild animals and ecology presented both 
great opportunity and even greater challenges for Native Americans, mountain men, fur 
traders, wagon-masters, homesteaders, gold miners, lumberjacks, cowboys and lawmen 
of the Wild West. (Part 1 of 3) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook: London - East Meets West - Acclaimed cook and 

food writer Rachel Khoo gets re-acquainted with her home-town of London and its exciting 
lifestyle and fantastic food. In this episode, Rachel whips up her favourite Malaysian 
dessert (adding a British twist), and shows us fabulous ideas for using up leftover roast 
meat in a soft steamed Asian bun. (Ep.6) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm 24 Hours In Emergency - Out Of Sight - 10-year-old Josh arrives at St George’s having 

severed his finger during an accident on the school playing field. Mum Jane accompanies 
Josh into resus, but she has a secret - Josh has no idea that his finger has actually been 
cut off during the accident. Doctors now face a double challenge: to work out whether they 
can re-attach his finger, which will require major surgery, and how and when to explain to 
Josh what has really happened. (s.8 Ep.6) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) M(A) CC   

 
8:30 pm Richard Hammond's Wild Weather - Water, The Shape Shifter - Richard Hammond 

investigates the crucial role water plays, in all its forms. He tries to weigh a cloud, finds out 
how rain could crush a car and gets involved in starting an avalanche. Along the way, he 
tries to find out why clouds float by building his own cloud. He also drops in on renowned 
hail scientist Charles Knight in his lab in Boulder, Colorado, to discover that there is far 
more to hail than meets the eye. Richard joins the WSL Institute for Snow and Avalanche 
Research SLF as he starts an avalanche in an attempt to find out how something as 
delicate and fragile as a snowflake can travel at extraordinary speeds of up to 250mph on 
the ground. (Part 2 of 3) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
9:35 pm The Five - Mark persuades Pru to help him find Simon’s dad, but is shocked when he 

realises that Kenton might be hiding a dark secret of his own. Danny and Ally are 
perplexed when they find another body. Could it be Jesse?  (S.1 Ep.4) (From the UK) 
(Drama Series) M(V) CC **New Episode** 

 
10:30 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
11:00 pm The World Game - Join the SBS football team for highlights and previews, plus the best 

action, news and exclusive interviews from around the football world. (An SBS Production) 
(Football/Soccer) CC   
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11:30 pm Modus - Based on the bestselling novels by Anne Holt, this Swedish detective thriller 

follows psychologist and ex-FBI profiler Inger Johanne Vik as she finds herself and her 
autistic daughter drawn into an investigation surrounding a series of disturbing and brutal 
deaths. To protect her daughter, she must catch the murderer. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Sweden, 
in English & Norwegian) (Drama Series) M(V,L) CC **New Series Premiere**    

 
12:25 am Modus - After Inger's daughter is diagnosed with autism, she begins to realise what her 

daughter must be going through. Detective Ingvar Nyman goes to Uppsala to investigate 
the murder of Elisabeth Lindgren, which took place on Christmas Eve. It's obvious that 
secrets lie in Uppsala. (S.1 Ep.2) (From Sweden, in Swedish & English) (Drama Series) 
M(V,L) CC **New Episode** 

 
 MOVIE: 
1:20 am 13 Semesters - When Momo leaves his small home town to go to university, he is full of 

enthusiasm and confidence, but slowly the pressures of study and campus living begin to 
grind him down. Half way through his course he finds himself at a crossroads with both his 
relationship and studies. An endearing comedy/drama from acclaimed director Frieder 
Wittich. Stars Max Riemelt, Dieter Mann and Robert Gwisdek. (From Germany, in 
German) (Drama) (2009) (Rpt) M(S,L)   

 
3:10 am Room 101 - Julia Zemiro - This comedy interview show, hosted by Paul McDermott, sees 

celebrity guests discuss their pet hates with Paul in the hopes that he will banish them to 
the ‘Room 101 vault’ forever. In the first episode, multi-talented performer, writer, 
presenter and comedian Julia Zemiro joins Paul McDermott on Room 101. Paul takes 
Julia, the face of RocKwiz and Eurovision on SBS, back to the roots of her very own 
comedy, by exploring her pet hates regarding good etiquette and self-awareness. From 
Food service big bears with Buffets, to the ‘snake oil peddling’ life coaches, the High Fives 
plaguing society today to the ubiquitous packaging  Julia is adamant that Paul banish it all 
to the Room 101 vault. (S.1,Ep.1) (Commissioned by SBS) (Entertainment Series) (Rpt) 
PG CC   

 
3:40 am 24 Hours In Emergency - Wake Up Call - How a trip to emergency can act as a wake-up 

call. Malcolm is on life support after suffering a cardiac arrest. Meanwhile, 12-year-old 
Kamilla is rushed to King's after being knocked down by a car. (S.5,Ep.3) (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC   

 
4:35 am Sevilla - A woman, her boyfriend and his best male friend impulsively decide to make a 

road trip to Seville. (From the Netherlands, in Dutch & French) (Short Film) (Drama) (Rpt) 
M(N,L)   

 
4:50 am Lois - When a mysterious letter tips Lois over the edge, she is driven to wild lengths to 

address some unfinished business. (From Greece, in Greek) (Drama) (Short) (Rpt) G CC    
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Tuesday October 4th, 2016 
 

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Lost Songs Of St Kilda - This is the incredible story of the Lost Songs of St Kilda. Nearly 

a century ago, the last 36 residents were evacuated from the most remote part of the 
British Isles, St Kilda, an isolated island off the beautiful and rugged western coast of 
Scotland. Now, after 86 years, the music of St Kilda has been discovered, recorded in a 
Scottish care home by an elderly resident who was taught piano by a resident of St Kilda. 
(From Australia) (Documentary) (Class. tba) CC 

 
2:30 pm Good Listening – Cyrus Meher-Homji shares forgotten music from a remote Scottish 

island, Bach reworked and reconfigured, and a man who plays no less than nine different 
kinds of trumpets on a single album. (S.1 Ep.6) (From Australia) (Arts) (Classical Music) 
(Class. tba) CC    
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3:00 pm Portrait Of A City - Rome - All roads might lead to Rome, where visitors experience a 

beautiful city as well as a civilisation, and when you've seen for yourself what draws them 
here, it's easy to understand their reluctance to ever take to the road again. To paint a 
complete portrait of Rome would take a lifetime to achieve, but where ancient Roman 
treasures like the Colosseum can be found so close to such visual delights as St Peter's 
Square and the Trevi Fountain, inspiration is never far away. (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:30 pm Poh & Co Bitesize - Poh & Co. invites you into the always delicious world of acclaimed 

cook, artist and lover of life - Poh Ling Yeow. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC   
 
3:35 pm What's Wrong With Our Weather? - In 2010 Britain experienced the coldest December 

on record. In 2011 America experienced killer tornadoes, drought and wildfires. 2010 in 
Pakistan saw floods that killed over 1500 people. Across the world weather seems to be 
becoming more extreme. But why? Could it all be down to a phenomenon called the jet 
stream? Meteorologist and BBC weatherman John Hammond and oceanographer Dr 
Helen Czerski meet the scientists around the world who are trying to unlock the secrets of 
this mysterious force and finds out if it could be blamed for everything from Hurricane 
Sandy to the recent freezing winters. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:35 pm Caroline Quentin's National Parks - Loch Lomond - Popular actress Caroline Quentin 

visits three of the finest and most popular National Parks in Great Britain, taking on the 
role of tour guide through the breathtaking landscapes of Loch Lomond, the New Forest 
and Snowdonia. Drawing on her storytelling skills and passion for the great outdoors, she 
unlocks the secrets of these extraordinary places. Despite being on the same island, each 
of these stunning parks has their own distinctive qualities and rich array of wildlife, some 
specific to the individual regions.  The first episode finds her at Loch Lomond and the 
Trossachs in the South West of Scotland. (Part 1 of 3) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook: London - Traditional Values - Acclaimed cook and 

food writer Rachel Khoo gets re-acquainted with her home-town of London and its exciting 
lifestyle and fantastic food. In this episode, Rachel shares the very best of classic British 
fare with a visit to a quintessentially British pub, a traditional fry-up, and a fuss-free 
Sunday roast. (Ep.7) (From the UK) (Food Series) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Who Do You Think You Are? - Mal Meninga - Mal Meninga goes on a deeply personal 

quest to discover if he's descended from an indentured labourer - brought back from the 
Pacific Islands to work in the Queensland cane fields - in a culture replete with racism, 
kidnapping and slavery. His search takes him to Tanna Island in Vanuatu. He finds his 
ancestor spent time in a Christian mission at Kwamera. Mal must unravel conflicting 
accounds of why his ancestor left. Was he tricked or was he looking for adventure and 
opportunity? Back in Australia, Mal's confronted by the harsh conditions endured by 
Islanders working in the cane fields. Faced with deportation, the South Sea Islander 
community rallied to challenge the White Australia Policy. (S.4 Ep.8) (Commissioned by 
SBS) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   
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8:30 pm Insight - Australian current affairs forum, with lively debate and powerful first-person 

stories. Hosted by award-winning journalist Jenny Brockie. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
9:30 pm Dateline - A world of daring stories - Dateline is an award-winning current affairs program 

bringing you the unexpected from every corner of the globe. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
10:00 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
10:30 pm Italy 1992 - Luca, a policeman, obtains the revenge he is seeking, but justice is another 

matter. Advertising man Leo finds himself under the threat of blackmail: someone has dug 
out some murky truth about his past. (S.1 Ep.3) (From Italy, in Italian) (Drama Series) 
MA(S) CC **New Double Episodes**   

 
11:30 pm Italy 1992 - A new chance comes up for Veronica: her dreams again seem within reach. 

Bibi is confronted with a reponsibility she had so far managed to elude. (S.1 Ep.4) (From 
Italy, in Italian) (Drama Series) M(S,N,A,L) **New Double Episodes**    

 
12:35 am Life, Above All - Following the death of her baby sister, 12-year-old Chanda learns of a 

rumour that spreads like wildfire through her small, dust-ridden village near Johannesburg. 
It destroys her family and forces her mother to flee. Sensing that the gossip stems from 
prejudice and superstition, Chanda leaves home and school in search of her mother and 
the truth. This touching mother-daughter story was an award winner at the Cannes Film 
Festival in 2010. Directed by Oliver Schmitz and stars Khomotso Manyaka, Keaobaka 
Makanyane and Harriet Lenabe. (From South Africa, in Sepedi) (Drama) (2010) (Rpt) 
M(A) CC   

 
2:30 am 24 Hours In Police Custody - A Short, Sharp Shock - This eight-part documentary 

series provides a unique insight into the challenges facing the police in the 21st century. 
Filmed using a combination of fixed and handheld cameras, the program follows the 
officers of the Bedfordshire Police as they go about their daily work. In this episode, two 
teenage girls are arrested after a fight breaks out in a nightclub. And the police also arrest 
a 61-year-old man who's never spent a night in the cells before. (S.1,Ep.2) (From the UK) 
Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
3:25 am One Born Every Minute - In this series return meet the straight-talking midwifery team in 

Bristol as an expectant father risks missing his daughter's birth and one of the team helps 
her next-door neighbour through an emotional labour. Michelle and Michael's parents are 
from different countries: hers are Chinese, his British. They're both self-confessed gadget 
geeks, and are praying for a less traumatic birth second time round. Michelle lost a lot of 
blood during her first labour and Michael was traumatised by the experience. He's 
determined to be by her side for this delivery, but in a quiet few hours, he decides to head 
home for the evening and Michelle's contractions suddenly kick in. (S.5,Ep.1) (From the 
UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(A) CC   

 
4:20 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, we meet local baking legend 
Dorothy Press at the Condobolin annual show; Afghan bread with Ahmed Sultani; chefs 
tell why the Japanese want our wagyu beef; and a visit to Perth’s Italian food pioneers. 
(An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   
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4:55 am Destination Flavour Scandinavia Bitesize - Join Adam Liaw as he revisits the highlights 

from his Scandinavian food adventures. (From Australia) (Food) (Rpt) G CC    
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Wednesday October 5th, 2016 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Brits Who Built The Modern World - The Power of the Past - The story of how an 

exceptional generation of British architects, led by Norman Foster and Richard Rogers, 
conquered the globe with their high tech vision. This second episode of the series focuses 
on the 1980s, when modern architecture was deeply unpopular - and under attack from 
the Prince of Wales. The architects reveal the dramatic stories behind some of their most 
famous creations, including Rogers’ Lloyd’s of London building and Foster’s Stansted 
Airport.  Terry Farrell reveals how he was kept in the dark when he was designing the MI6 
Headquarters, and Michael Hopkins recalls the challenges of bringing ultra-modern 
architecture into the traditional world of Lord’s Cricket Ground. (Part 2 of 3) (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Arts) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
3:00 pm Dateline - A world of daring stories - Dateline is an award-winning current affairs program 

bringing you the unexpected from every corner of the globe. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
3:30 pm Insight - Australian current affairs forum, with lively debate and powerful first-person 

stories. Hosted by award-winning journalist Jenny Brockie. (An SBS Production) CC   
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4:30 pm Wild Arabia - Sand Wind and Stars - Arabia is a breathtaking mix of deserts, seas, 

mystery and romance. This beautiful series reveals the surprising connections between 
the nature, people, landscape and history of this little known kingdom. Few places on 
earth evoke more mystery and romance than Arabia. Now for the first time we are able to 
enter the forbidding wilderness and reveal a magical cast a characters. From snow-white 
oryx that inspired the myth of the unicorn to long-legged jerboa leaping ten times their own 
body length through the star-filled Arabian nights. Horned vipers hunt glow-in-dark 
scorpions while Bedouin nomads race their camels across the largest sand desert in the 
world. (Part 1 of 3) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook: London - On The Move - Acclaimed cook and food 

writer Rachel Khoo gets re-acquainted with her home-town of London and its exciting 
lifestyle and fantastic food. In this episode, the hustle and bustle and constant flow of 
people all around the city constantly inspires Rachel’s cooking (whether it’s the iconic 
London Tube or the sea of taxis). (Ep.8) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Great American Railroad Journeys - Washington DC To Mount Vernon - Continuing 

his trek from Philadelphia to Jamestown, Michael Portillo arrives in the nation's capital, 
Washington, DC, centre of political power in the world's most powerful country. Steered by 
his Appleton's Guide of 1879, he admires its fine public buildings, including the largest 
library in the world, and discovers how the capital was built from scratch after a political 
compromise between north and south. After this, he travels on to Mount Vernon, exploring 
a former slave market and visiting an archaeological dig along the way. (S.1 Ep.7) (From 
the UK) (Documentary Series) PG CC   

 
8:30 pm Deep Water - A four-part, fictional crime drama set in contemporary Bondi, featuring a 

stellar cast of Australian actors. The drama unfolds when Tori Lustigman (Yael Stone; 
Orange is the New Black) relocates from the country to her childhood suburb of Bondi with 
her teenage son Will (Otis Pavlovic), to put the past firmly behind her and start life over. 
Partnered with Detective Nick Manning (Noah Taylor; Game of Thrones), they're assigned 
to investigate the brutal murder of a young man whose mutilated corpse is found in an 
apartment. Is this brutal murder a domestic, a robbery gone wrong, or something far more 
sinister? (Part 1 of 4) (Commissioned by SBS) (Drama Series) (Class. tba) CC   

 
9:35 pm 24 Hours In Emergency - Stay With Me - In this week’s episode those providing the 

bedside support take centre stage as a girlfriend, a wife and a daughter keep spirits high 
in difficult times. First up is 22-year-old Paul who’s been stabbed in the face and arm with 
a broken bottle outside a pub in Kingston. Meanwhile 93-year-old Angela is brought to 
emergency by her daughter Elizabeth after suffering from blood loss and disorientation at 
her care home. (S.6,Ep.4) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
10:30 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
 



SBS Program Guide – Week 41 (2016) 

 

Wednesday October 5th, 2016 
 
11:00 pm First Contact - The group arrives on Elcho Island where around 2,500 Aboriginal people 

live in some of the most deprived conditions in the western world. The six are shocked but 
in amongst the helplessness, there’s hope. Next in Alice Springs, Ray Martin directs the 
travellers to join a night patrol service which helps the drunk and vulnerable. It’s not long 
before tempers flare. Emotions are then pushed to the limit as the group meet women 
struggling with addiction and share their own life traumas. For one of the six, the journey 
into Aboriginal Australia becomes all too much to take… Next stop is the Pilbara where a 
very different side of the mining business will be revealed. (Part 2 of 3) (Commissioned by 
SBS) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
 MOVIE: 
12:05 am Bethlehem - Recruited as an informant by the Israeli secret service, a Palestinian man 

finds himself caught between two different kinds of loyalty in this unparalleled glimpse into 
the dark world of human intelligence. (From Israel, in Arabic & Hebrew) (Movie) (Drama) 
(2013) M(V,L)    

 
MOVIE: 

1:55 am Mother - When a mentally disabled boy is arrested for the murder of a young girl in rural 
South Korea, the case is quickly closed thanks to an inefficient lawyer and an apathetic 
police force. It's left to the boy's widowed mother to find the girl's killer and to prove her 
son's innocence. Winner of three Asian Film Awards in 2010, including Best Film. Directed 
by Joon-ho Bong and stars Hye-ja Kim, Bin Won and Ku Jin. (From South Korea, in 
Korean) (Mystery/Crime) (2009) (Rpt) MA(S,V)   

 
4:20 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, chef Romano Rotelli of 
Pensiero Restaurant; the Danish horn of plenty at Bonjour Patisserie; exotic mushrooms 
at Li-Sun Exotic Mushrooms; molecular gastronomy; and caipirhinias with Brazilian soccer 
stars. (An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:55 am Destination Flavour Scandinavia Bitesize - Join Adam Liaw as he revisits the highlights 

from his Scandinavian food adventures. (From Australia) (Food) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Contact - Guy Le Querrec: Miles Davis - This series explores work from iconic agency 

Magnum. This episode looks at the work of French photographer, Guy Le Querrec, who 
captured Jazz musician Miles Davis. (From Italy, in English) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) 
PG CC 

 
2:30 pm Big Art - Colours Are The Country - Clients rarely ask more from a piece of art than the 

Macquarie Group: having spent hundreds of millions in a stunning restoration of a Sydney 
beaux arts building, the corporation wants to fill the last remaining space - a clunky, 
inaccessible ten storey light well - with an artwork that will not only look ravishing, it will 
drive entrepreneurial creativity among their staff. (S.1,Ep.1) (Australia) (Documentary 
Series) (Rpt) G CC   
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3:00 pm Tales From The Bush Larder - Lake Victoria Whitebait - This series takes viewers on a 

tour of Kenya and her more unusual and unknown gastronomic delights. Host Kiran 
Jethwa, a Kenyan-born and internationally trained chef, has returned from a global 
gastronomic education to settle in his home country. Kiran travels the length and breadth 
of Kenya to source rare and highly prized ingredients, primarily in the ‘bush larder’, 
meeting diverse people from many different tribal backgrounds and exploring landscapes 
ranging from the highlands of Mount Kenya to the Lamu archipelago. (From the 
Netherlands, in English and Swahili) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:25 pm Italian Americans - Loyal Americans (1930–1945) - During the 1930s and 1940s, a 

second generation of Italian Americans begins to enter the labour movement, politics, 
sports and entertainment. Fiorello LaGuardia beats Tammany Hall, the Irish Political 
machine in New York, to become Mayor and represent the ‘little guy’. Joe DiMaggio, the 
son of a fisherman in San Francisco, becomes a powerhouse, who breaks the record for 
consecutive hits and becomes an All-American hero. But with the outbreak of World War 
II, Italians' loyalty to America is questioned and they are forced to choose between two 
nations at war. While many Italian Americans fight on the frontlines with valour and 
bravery, other Italian Americans are labelled ‘Enemy Aliens’. (From the US) (Documentary 
Series) (Part 3 of 4) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
4:25 pm British Gardens In Time - Nymans - This four-part series, narrated by Paul Copley, 

takes a close look at four iconic gardens created during four very different eras. Each 
garden provides a fascinating window into a different century and the people that 
established it. Nymans, one of the most fashionable and romantic gardens of the 
Edwardian and interwar years, was the creation of a family of German émigrés of Jewish 
descent. The Messels arrived in Britain in 1870 at a time when both anti-Semitism and 
anti-German sentiment were rife. Nevertheless, Ludwig Messel succeeded in establishing 
a successful stockbroking firm and creating at Nymans the quintessential English garden 
with rare plants and a theatrical herbaceous border inspired by William Robinson. (From 
the UK) (Documentary Series) (Final) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook: London - DIY - Acclaimed cook and food writer 

Rachel Khoo gets re-acquainted with her home-town of London and its exciting lifestyle 
and fantastic food. In this episode, Rachel visits a Norwegian-style smokehouse in North 
London (in a transformed basement), and she samples some of Lillie’s homemade 
preserves and jams at the London Borough of Jam. (Ep.9) (From the UK) (Food Series) 
(Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Michael Mosley: Eat, Fast And Live Longer - Michael Mosley has set himself a truly 

ambitious goal: he wants to live longer, stay younger and lose weight. And he thinks he's 
found the answer - the ancient idea of fasting. Could the powerful new science behind this 
idea lead to a longer, healthier life? Mosley thinks he's found a way of fasting that still 
allows him to enjoy his food. It sounds too good to be true. So he decides to take a road 
trip across the US to investigate how a little hunger can make you younger, and of course, 
to try out some of this new science for himself. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   
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8:30 pm Deep Water - A four-part fictional crime drama set in contemporary Bondi, featuring a 

stellar cast of Australian actors. Tori Lustigman (Yael Stone) relocates from the country to 
her childhood suburb of Bondi to put the past firmly behind her. Partnered with Detective 
Nick Manning (Noah Taylor), they're assigned to investigate the brutal murder of a young 
man. After a fatal shooting, tensions rise between Tori and Nick. Meanwhile, another body 
is found and evidence link a former football legend to the past crimes. (Part 2 of 4) 
(Commissioned by SBS) (Drama Series) (Class. tba) CC    

 
9:35 pm Death Row - Robert Fratta - Internationally renowned filmmaker Werner Herzog explores 

what it's like to face death by speaking to prisoners who are on death row. This episode 
Werner meets Robert Fratta, who was a public safety officer in Missouri City, Texas, but is 
now facing the death penalty for organising the murder of his ex-wife. (Ep.2) (From 
Germany, in English) (Documentary) (Rpt) MA(A) CC   

 
10:35 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
11:05 pm The Erotic Adventures Of Anais Nin - Married to a banker and living in 1930s Paris, 

Anais Nin meets American writer Henry Miller and his wife June, beginning her pursuit of 
pleasure and literary art. Featuring sensual reconstructions and interviews with Nin 
experts, this is the story of a feminist pioneer of erotica, still among the most frank 
descriptions of female sexual experience. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Sexuality) MA(S) 
**Premiere** 

 
  MOVIE: 
12:25 am At The End Of Daybreak - Looking to escape the burden of his alcoholic mother, 23-

year-old Tuck strikes up an illicit online relationship with Ying, a 15-year-old schoolgirl. A 
stark portrait of troubled youth, dysfunctional family life and tragedy. Winner of two awards 
at the 2010 Asian Film Awards, including Best Actress (Kara Hui). Directed by talented 
Malaysian director Yuhang Ho and also stars Chui Tien You and Meng Hui Ng. (From 
Hong Kong, in Cantonese, Malay and Mandarin) (Drama) (2009) (Rpt) M(A,L,S)   

 
2:10 am Restaurant Man - 7 Bone - Two best friends with no catering experience whatsoever quit 

their jobs in the city and risk their life savings to set up an edgy burger restaurant in 
Southampton. Considering the flat economy and an already saturated burger market, their 
confidence could be dangerously naive. But with a plethora of problems including the 
burger, the service and the layout of the restaurant, Rich and Matt's dream is far from  
reality. But with some guidance from restaurateur Russel Norman and after months of 
preparation and hard work, will their friendship survive, and will they open their  doors to 
their first paying customer? (S.1,Ep.7) (From the UK) (Food/Documentary Series) (Rpt) 
PG CC   

 
3:20 am Who Do You Think You Are? - Jane Horrocks - English actor, musician and singer 

Jane Horrocks' family history is rooted in Lancashire; three generations of her family lived 
in the same street in Rawtenstall. Her ancestors form part of the town's cotton weaving 
heritage, and Jane's search focuses on the strong women in the family, particularly her 
great-grandmother Sarah Cunliffe. She also uncovers some secret, unknown relatives, 
and identifies the mysterious black sheep of the family who migrated to Australia. (S.2 
Ep.9) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC    
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4:25 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, a visit to the Ord River to learn 
about a chickpea called the macarena; the fine art of dessert with Ryoichi Shiratsgu; 
Victoria's rich black asparagus fields at Koo Wee Rup; and wild Singapore girls at a bridal 
shower. (An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Colour Theory - From the northernmost tip of far north Queensland, Teho Ropeyarn's 

bold prints have traversed Australia, winning awards and representing the distinctive 
culture of the Torres Strait Islands. (S.2 Ep.3) (From Australia) (Arts) (Rpt) G CC   

 
2:30 pm Colour Theory - Megan Cope - For Megan Cope the dreamtime is a creation story, one 

that is constantly being created. Her painterly maps of country reveal an Aboriginal 
perspective and that, for Megan, the dreaming is now. (S. 2 Ep.12) (From Australia) (Arts) 
(Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm The Point Review - NITV National News features the rich diversity of contemporary life 

within Aboriginal and Torres Strait Islander communities, broadening and redefining the 
news and current affairs landscape. (An NITV Production)   

 
3:30 pm Heston's In Search Of Perfection - Baked Alaska - Culinary alchemist Heston 

Blumenthal creates a perfect version of the Seventies dessert trolley classic, Baked 
Alaska. Heston's research begins at Delmonico's restaurant in New York, inventors of the 
dish. Convinced that its intrigue lies in its hot-cold contrast, he goes to the DIY store to 
buy roof insulation. Experiments take him as far as Bristol University and involve hot jam, 
white chocolate tubes and dry ice. (S.2,Ep.5) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   
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4:00 pm Heston's In Search Of Perfection - Chilli Con Carne - Culinary alchemist Heston 

Blumenthal recreates favourite dishes: this time, chilli con carne. The quest takes him to 
the Washington DC Chilli Cook-Off competition where he samples the 'Chuck Norris chilli', 
and a chocolate chilli. Convinced that the essence of the dish lies in its heat, he samples a 
variety of chilli peppers including the Somalian Hot and the Devil's Penis. The finished 
dish includes bourbon and beef short ribs, accompanied by a sour cream sorbet and 
sweetcorn muffin. (S.2,Ep.6) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:30 pm Who Do You Think You Are? - Kate Humble - Television presenter Kate Humble knows 

little about her family history. On the trail of her paternal grandfather Bill Humble, who was 
a test pilot during the war, she visits the RAF Museum to learn more. Kate also wants to 
find out more about her maternal grandfather Stanley Carter, and what happened to him 
as a prisoner of war. She discovers that Stanley was at Stalag Luft III - the camp 
immortalised in the Hollywood blockbuster, The Great Escape. (From the UK) 
(Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook: London - The Pleasure's All Mine - Acclaimed cook 

and food writer Rachel Khoo gets re-acquainted with her home-town of London and its 
exciting lifestyle and fantastic food. In the series finale, Rachel seeks out some of 
London's luxurious treats, including champagne high tea in Mayfair, and she whips up 
some delectable recipes to try at home. (Final) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:35 pm The Private Lives Of The Tudors - The Rise of Henry VIII - Lives, loves and scandals. 

This is an intimate look behind the closed doors of one of the most celebrated royal 
dynasties: the Tudors. Based on a book by Tracy Borman and packed with atmospheric 
reconstructions, it brings to life history's enduring personalities, and the age in which they 
lived. Armed with fresh research, historian Tracy Borman reveals the truth about 
everything from the Tudor bedding ceremony to Henry VIII's affairs. (Part 1 of 3) (From the 
UK) (Documentary Series) PG CC **New Series Premiere** 

 
 MOVIE: 
8:30 pm Philomena - When former journalist Martin Sixsmith is dismissed from the Labour Party in 

disgrace, he is at a loss as to what do. That changes when a young Irish woman 
approaches him about a story of her mother, Philomena, who had her son taken away 
when she was a teenage inmate of a Catholic convent. Martin arranges a magazine 
assignment about her search for him that eventually leads to America. Along the way, 
Martin and Philomena discover as much about each other as about her son's fate. (From 
the UK) (Movie) (Drama) (2013) (Class. tba) CC    

 
10:20 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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  MOVIE: 
10:55 pm Dom Hemingway - After serving 12 years in prison, a skilled safecracker (Jude Law) 

seeks payback and a chance to reconcile with his daughter (Emilia Clarke). (From the UK) 
(Movie) (Comedy) MA(V,L) CC   

 
12:35 am The Bridge - Saga and Martin investigate the killing of the eco-terrorists and Saga rules 

out suicide. They learn that there must be a leader still alive out there who’s been pulling 
the strings all along. They track him to a Copenhagen-based IT company, but he seems to 
have gone underground. They must determine if new attacks are being planned, and if 
there are more terrorist cells. Meanwhile, Martin hits it off with his Danish colleague 
Pernille, and it looks like it could be more than just friendship. (From Denmark, in Swedish 
and Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(V,S,L) CC   

 
1:45 am The Bridge - Laura, a key witness, wakes up at the hospital suffering from amnesia, but 

Saga believes she might have seen something as she was shot and wounded. The 
investigation grows, offering up some new leads. Meanwhile, four individuals wearing 
animal masks carry out a new attack, and then post a video online where they claim 
responsibility. Saga and Martin try to track down the new group, who are busy planning 
yet another attack. Saga has a hard time getting used to living together with her boyfriend, 
and feels she needs to be alone, so she decides to check into a hotel, a decision she’ll 
come to regret. Meanwhile, Martin goes back to visit Jens in prison, and this time he 
exceeds his authority.  (From Denmark, in Swedish & Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(V)   

 
2:55 am The Bridge - Martin is at the hospital watching over his son, Nikolaj, who has suddenly 

fallen ill. Saga goes there to update him on the case, and notices something isn’t quite 
right at the hospital. The investigation intensifies as another poisoning is connected to 
Saga and Martin’s case. Furthermore, a motorboat is recovered from the bottom of the 
sea. In the boat, old skeletal remains are found. Who were these people, and what did 
they die of? Are they connected to the larger case? Jens doesn’t want Martin visiting him 
in prison anymore, but Martin won’t back down. Meanwhile, Saga is nervous ahead of her 
first meeting with her potential mother-in-law, and wonders if she’s being a good enough 
girlfriend. (From Denmark, in Swedish & Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(L) CC   

 
4:00 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, old fashioned fish and chips; 
fantastic fruit flavoured gels; soft slippery tofu made by Joo Pum Kim; chef Bethany Finn 
from Urban Bistro; and a country feast that's fit for a king. (An SBS Production) (Food 
Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:35 am So Very Cute - Somewhere in Eastern Europe, a girl goes to a casting. (From France, in 

English & Russian) (Short Film) (Drama) (2013) (Rpt) M(A) CC   
 
4:50 am Swim - 'She' dives toward something unclear, leaving behind the safety of the known - 

rewarding regardless of the outcome. From conception to completion, Swim was made in 
the space of four weeks - the first collaboration between Director Isabelle Pearl Love-Dack 
and Screenwriter, Producer and Star Isabella Jane Giovinazzo since they graduated from 
Swinburne Film School. (From Australia) (Short) (Drama) (2012) (Rpt) (PG) CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Small Business Secrets - In this episode we check out the small businesses making a 

huge impact on social economic issues. We visit Melbourne social enterprise Pollinate 
Energy, who are lighting up Indian slums with solar lighting, and fly to Hong Kong to drop 
in on Les Beatitudes, the stay-at-home mums making purses out of neckties to support 
their family. We head to Brisbane to auto repair shop Brothers Garage, who train up at-
risk youth, asylum seekers and the disabled, and visit Dick Smith in his Sydney home to 
gain his business insight. We also explore the young Australians fighting the global water 
crisis, and check out a warehouse employing those from disadvantaged backgrounds to 
recycle mattresses from landfills. (S.1 Ep.10) (SBS Production) (Documentary Series) 
(Class. tba) CC **Encore**   

 
2:30 pm Cats Uncovered - Aloof. Disdainful. Vicious. Or friendly, fluffy balls of fur who just want to 

be loved. Opinions on cats tend to differ though one thing is sure - they occupy a very 
special place in the hearts of many. But how much do we really know about them? Making 
use of the latest bespoke technology, this fascinating and revealing series investigates 
every aspect of the lives of this often-misunderstood species. (Part 1 of 3) (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   
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3:30 pm The Classic Car Show - The last of Quentin's all time classics is the British built Jensen 

Interceptor. Italian styling and a colossal American V8 engine made it the coolest thing 
ever to come out of Birmingham. (S.1 Ep.12) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) 
PG CC    

 
4:20 pm The Story Of Luxury - The Middle Ages - A Deadly Sin? - Luxury isn't just a question of 

expensive and the beautiful objects for the rich and the powerful. It has always been much 
more - and much more important - than that, especially in the ancient and mediaeval 
worlds. This second episode follows the clash between luxury and Christianity which 
convulsed medieval Europe. (Part 2 of 2) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:25 pm Who Do You Think You Are? - Jason Donovan - Actor/singer Jason Donovan comes 

from showbiz parents who divorced when he was five. His British born father won custody 
and brought him up alone, but it's Jason's mother's family line that holds the key to his 
Australian heritage - up to now a complete mystery to him. Starting in his hometown of 
Melbourne, Jason wants to understand why his mother went missing from his life during 
his childhood. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:35 pm Million Dollar American Princesses - Leading Ladies - Elizabeth McGovern follows the 

journeys of three extraordinary women who transform their lives - Nancy Astor, the first 
woman to take her seat in the British Parliament; Nancy Lancaster, legendary creator of 
the 'English Country House Look'; and international style icon Pauline de Rothschild. (S.2 
Ep.4) (From the US) (Documentary Series) PG CC   

 
 MOVIE: 
8:35 pm The Words - When Rory Jansen publishes his first book it is that rare, once in a 

generation event that takes the literary world and the public imagination by storm. Friends 
breathlessly recommend it, critics rave about it; it’s everywhere - from book clubs, to 
airplanes, to college campuses. With a voice that’s fresh, and a wisdom about life that 
somehow seems to be timeless, Rory becomes an instant literary star. Charismatic, 
talented, intelligent, the young author seems to have it all: a beautiful life, a loving wife the 
world at his fingertips - and it’s all because of his words. But whose words are they? And 
whose story is this, after all? (From the US) (Movie) (Drama) (2012) (Rpt) M(L) CC   

 
10:25 pm Cucumber - Lance tries to work out the truth about Daniel, so Henry takes a final, 

desperate chance to win his old boyfriend back. But with their past history falling away, the 
lure of Canal Street calling, and Lance spellbound by his new man, is it too late for any of 
them to change paths? (Ep.6) (From the UK) (Drama Series) MA(V,S,L) CC  

 
11:20 pm Cucumber - When a manhunt goes wrong, Henry, Freddie and Dean are trapped 

together and some long-buried truths rise to the surface. With Marie arriving in town to 
take charge, and events at the flatshare reaching a climax, Henry’s running out of options 
– but he’s dangerous when cornered. (S.1,Ep.7) (From the UK) (Drama Series) (Rpt) 
MA(S,N) CC   

 
12:20 am Cucumber - Everyone gets caught up in Henry’s grand scheme, and life appears to be 

perfect. But only Freddie realises the truth. As events of the past catch up with them all, 
Henry reaches out to family, friends and lovers in order to survive, and yet he still has to 
face the greatest challenge of all. (Final) (Ep.8) (From the UK) (Drama Series) (Rpt) 
MA(S,L) CC   
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1:15 am Real Humans - Blood Runs Thick - A virus is spreading like a pandemic, making 

infected hubots uncontrollable and dangerous. Bea is reactivated after several months, 
and she resumes her desperate search for David's lost code. (Series Return) (From 
Sweden, in Swedish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(S,V)   

 
2:25 am Real Humans - Bea continues searching for the code that makes machines human. In her 

search for the scientist David Eischer’s clone, she seeks out David’s mother. Tobias 
struggles with his transhuman sexuality, as his heart still longs for Mimi. The Engman 
family receives a package containing their Granddad’s clone. Meanwhile, at Hub Battle 
Land, Silas works to get the business off the ground and Roger arrives for a job interview. 
(From Sweden, in Swedish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(A,V) CC   

 
3:35 am Real Humans - Bea and Cloette have finally located David’s clone, but the brain is 

missing. They continue their search while Tobias and Matilda investigate the code on the 
USB drive. A segment is missing and Matilda suspects that Mimi knows more than she 
lets on. When Roger is sent out to pick up a hubot, he’s in for an unpleasant reunion. 
Florentine’s dream is about to come true - she’s finally going to marry her Douglas. But 
perhaps human life is not all it’s cracked up to be. (S.2, Ep.3) (From Sweden, in Swedish) 
(Drama Series) (Rpt) M(S,V,L)   

 
4:45 am Spine - Nick is a young quadriplegic struggling to come to terms with his injury. Whilst 

waiting for his girlfriend in a supermarket carpark, he witnesses a brutal crime. Trapped in 
his car, he is powerless to intervene. (Short Film) (Drama) (Rpt) MA(L) CC   

 


