
 

  

 
 
 
   

Program Guide  
Week 46                               

           
              

        
Sunday November 6th, 2016 

      
5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 

(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   
 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Premier League Match: Manchester City V Middlesbrough Live - Manchester City v 

Middlesbrough - SBS football reporter Lucy Zelic and SBS football analyst and former 
Cyrstal Palace player Craig Foster will host live coverage as Manchester City take on 
Middlesbrough at Etihad Stadium. (Football/Soccer) **Replay**   
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Sunday November 6th, 2016 
EASTERN STATES (NSW, ACT, VIC, TAS) 

 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
3:00 pm National Basketball League: Illawarra Hawks V Melbourne Utd - Live coverage of the 

NBL 2016-17 as Illawarra Hawks take on Melbourne United at Hisense Arena in 
Melbourne, Victoria. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**   

 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This episode checks out the sustainable small businesses 

looking after the environment, including the father-daughter team making recyclable and 
sustainable furniture. Grab some dessert with Serendipity, an ice cream company hwo cut 
80 percent of their carbon emissions by switching to 100 percent green energy, and visit a 
cafe trading fresh fruit and vegetables to pickle. Ricardo also speaks to Ronnie Khan, 
founder of one of Australia's most successful social enterprises Oz Harvest, and heads to 
Canberra to explore how some homes are buying and selling spare energy. (S.1 Ep.15) 
(An SBS Production) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   

 
 

 
Sunday November 6th, 2016 

SOUTH AUSTRALIA 
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
2:30 pm National Basketball League: Illawarra Hawks V Melbourne Utd - Live coverage of the 

NBL 2016-17 as Illawarra Hawks take on Melbourne United at Hisense Arena in 
Melbourne, Victoria. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**   

 
4:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This episode checks out the sustainable small businesses 

looking after the environment, including the father-daughter team making recyclable and 
sustainable furniture. Grab some dessert with Serendipity, an ice cream company hwo cut 
80 percent of their carbon emissions by switching to 100 percent green energy, and visit a 
cafe trading fresh fruit and vegetables to pickle. Ricardo also speaks to Ronnie Khan, 
founder of one of Australia's most successful social enterprises Oz Harvest, and heads to 
Canberra to explore how some homes are buying and selling spare energy. (S.1 Ep.15) 
(An SBS Production) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   
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Sunday November 6th, 2016 
QUEENSLAND 

 
12:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
2:00 pm National Basketball League: Illawarra Hawks V Melbourne Utd - Live coverage of the 

NBL 2016-17 as Illawarra Hawks take on Melbourne United at Hisense Arena in 
Melbourne, Victoria. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**   

 
4:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
4:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This episode checks out the sustainable small businesses 

looking after the environment, including the father-daughter team making recyclable and 
sustainable furniture. Grab some dessert with Serendipity, an ice cream company hwo cut 
80 percent of their carbon emissions by switching to 100 percent green energy, and visit a 
cafe trading fresh fruit and vegetables to pickle. Ricardo also speaks to Ronnie Khan, 
founder of one of Australia's most successful social enterprises Oz Harvest, and heads to 
Canberra to explore how some homes are buying and selling spare energy. (S.1 Ep.15) 
(An SBS Production) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   

 
 

 
 
 

Sunday November 6th, 2016 
NORTHERN TERRITORY 

 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This episode checks out the sustainable small businesses 

looking after the environment, including the father-daughter team making recyclable and 
sustainable furniture. Grab some dessert with Serendipity, an ice cream company hwo cut 
80 percent of their carbon emissions by switching to 100 percent green energy, and visit a 
cafe trading fresh fruit and vegetables to pickle. Ricardo also speaks to Ronnie Khan, 
founder of one of Australia's most successful social enterprises Oz Harvest, and heads to 
Canberra to explore how some homes are buying and selling spare energy. (S.1 Ep.15) 
(An SBS Production) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   

 
1:30 pm National Basketball League: Illawarra Hawks V Melbourne Utd - Live coverage of the 

NBL 2016-17 as Illawarra Hawks take on Melbourne United at Hisense Arena in 
Melbourne, Victoria. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**   

 
3:30 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
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Sunday November 6th, 2016 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 
12:00 pm National Basketball League: Illawarra Hawks V Melbourne Utd - Live coverage of the 

NBL 2016-17 as Illawarra Hawks take on Melbourne United at Hisense Arena in 
Melbourne, Victoria. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**   

 
2:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
4:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
4:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This episode checks out the sustainable small businesses 

looking after the environment, including the father-daughter team making recyclable and 
sustainable furniture. Grab some dessert with Serendipity, an ice cream company hwo cut 
80 percent of their carbon emissions by switching to 100 percent green energy, and visit a 
cafe trading fresh fruit and vegetables to pickle. Ricardo also speaks to Ronnie Khan, 
founder of one of Australia's most successful social enterprises Oz Harvest, and heads to 
Canberra to explore how some homes are buying and selling spare energy. (S.1 Ep.15) 
(An SBS Production) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   
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Sunday November 6th, 2016 
ALL MARKETS REJOIN 

 
5:30 pm Nazi Megastructures - The Wolf's Lair - As European countries fall like dominoes to the 

all-conquering German armies, Hitler becomes convinced of his own military genius. He 
plans to invade Russia and orders the construction of a huge, heavily protected command 
complex of bunkers and buildings named the Wolfs Lair. But as he isolates himself in his 
concrete city the war begins to slip from his grasp, and a conspiracy is hatched to make 
the secret base his tomb. (S.2 Ep.3) (From the US) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC    

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm The Great Human Odyssey - Journey's End - Early humans eventually colonised 

Australia, the South Pacific, and the Americas. But how did our ancestors master the 
oceans? Learn how new discoveries in ancient DNA research are changing our 
understanding of the earliest sea voyages, from Easter Island to the Bering Strait. (Part 3 
of 3) (From Canada) (Documentary Series) PG(N,A) **Final Episode**      

 
8:35 pm Clinton V Trump: The Choice 2016 - With anticipation building in the lead-up to the 2016 

US Presidential Election, the duelling stories of opposing candidates Donald Trump and 
Hillary Clinton are exposed in this two-hour documentary premiere. This is a journey into 
the places, people, and decisive moments that made the people who are competing for 
US Presidency. Hundreds of hours of research and dozens of original interviews with 
those who knew them best reveal new details and fresh insights about them both - and the 
choice the American people have to make in November 2016. (From the US) 
(Documentary) (Class. tba) CC **Premiere**     

 
10:45 pm Snow Monkey - One of Australia's greatest photojournalists goes on a riveting first-hand 

journey through an Afghanistan never seen on the news. For almost 50 years, activist 
artist George Gittoes has stood on the frontlines of the world's most brutal conflicts and 
borne witness to the best and worst of humanity. Now living in Afghanistan's remote, 
Taliban-ruled Jalalabad province, Gittoes turns his attention to the lives of the children and 
outcasts of this war-torn land. He focuses on three gangs of children: the Ghostbusters, 
persecuted Kochi boys who hawk exorcisms of bad luck and demons; the Snow Monkeys, 
who sell ice cream to support their families; and the Gangsters, a razor gang led by a 9-
year-old antihero called Steel. With a deeply humane vision that won him the Sydney 
Peace Prize, Gittoes shows the unseen nature of Afghanistan's politics, culture and 
society, up close and startlingly personal. (From Australia, in English & Pashto) 
(Documentary) M(A,V) CC **Premiere** **George Gittoes Season** 

 
 MOVIE: 
1:35 am Undertow - An unusual ghost story set in a small Peruvian fishing village; a married 

fisherman struggles to reconcile his devotion to his male lover with his town's rigid 
traditions. Winner of the Audience Award for World Cinema at the 2010 Sundance Film 
Festival. Directed by Javier Fuentes-León and stars Cristian Mercado, Tatiana Astengo 
and Manolo Cardona. (From Peru, in Spanish) (Drama) (2009) (Rpt) MA (L,S) CC   
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Sunday November 6th, 2016 
 
3:25 am Strip The City - New York Superstorm City - This series uses stunning CGI animation 

and expedition-driven actuality to strip major cities naked of their steel, concrete, air, 
ocean and bedrock - layer by layer, act by act - to explore their hidden infrastructure and 
solve key mysteries surrounding their origins, geology, archaeology, industry, weather and 
engineering. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:20 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food around. In this episode, Japanese seaweed from Tasmania; 
Mediterranean-Australian cuisine; an organic wheat farm and liquorice factory; and a feast 
for Chinese New Year. (S.3 Ep.2) (An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:55 am Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook Melbourne Bitesize - Passionate food creator and 

writer, Rachel Khoo, uncovers Melbourne and the wider state of Victoria’s culinary 
wonders for the world to see. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC    
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Monday November 7th, 2016 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Al Jazeera News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in English.   
 
2:00 pm Unity: Latin Tribute To Michael Jackson - Fuelled by his relentless commitment, quiet 

determination and passionate faith in the loving message behind much of Jackson’s 
music, Succar has spent the last four years carefully creating this Latin tribute to the 
Prince of Pop. The groundbreaking album embodies Jackson’s spirit of harmony and 
bringing diverse cultures together through music. (From the US, in English & Spanish) 
(Entertainment) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm The Story of the Jews - Return -  This final episode examines how the Holocaust and 

the creation of Israel have fundamentally changed what it means to be Jewish. Mixing 
personal recollection with epic history, Schama tells the story of the remarkable 
personalities and unprecedented events which turned the Zionist dream of creating a 
modern state of Israel into reality - and the consequences for the world. He explores the 
tension between the high ideals and dire necessities that led to the creation of a Jewish 
homeland and the realities of conflict, dispossession and occupation that have followed in 
its wake. (Part 5 of 5) (From the UK) (Documentary) PG CC  
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Monday November 7th, 2016 
 
4:00 pm On A River In Ireland - Filmed over two years, this two-part series features extraordinary 

animal behaviour captured with the latest camera technology to reveal the natural world of 
Ireland as never seen before. Camping on the banks of the river Shannon, wandering its 
islands and paddling its many tributaries in his canoe, the series is hosted by 
internationally renowned wildlife presenter Colin Stafford-Johnson. Over the course of the 
production, Colin journeyed the length of the river dozens of times to bring to viewers this 
remarkable portrait of Ireland’s greatest river. (From Ireland) (Documentary Series) (Part 1 
of 2) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:00 pm noma australia - In the second episode, work continues at the restaurant; from the 

building of the kitchen and dining room, to the development of the menu in the noma test 
kitchen. As the project continues, the noma team explore the sights and sounds of the 
Sydney foreshore whilst gaining a different perspective on what the city has to offer. (Part 
2 of 3) (From Australia) (Commissioned by SBS) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC 

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Ainsley Harriott's Street Food - Barbados - Popular British chef and author Ainsley 

Harriott travels the globe looking for new street food, finding adventure and great cooking 
on route. Tonight, Ainsley visits Barbados, and ventures off the beaten track in search of 
local delicacies. He prepares roti on the beach, fries fishcakes at a roadside stall and 
spices up a mango and sweet pepper salad with an exceptionally hot sauce. He also 
samples flying fish, barbecue pig tails, spiced lobster, rum-glazed chicken and grilled 
coconut-crusted sweetcorn. (S.1,Ep.2) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm The Supervet - Five-year-old Great Dane Star is rushed to Fitzpatrick Referrals after 

losing the use of her back legs. She’s clearly in a lot of pain and Professor Noel Fitzpatrick 
needs to sedate her to allow him to determine the cause of her sudden paralysis. A 
slipped disk in her spinal column proves treatable, but later complications leave Star 
fighting for her life. (S.3 Ep.3) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) PG(A) CC **New 
Episode**    

 
8:30 pm The Supervet: Bionic Stories - Professor Noel Fitzpatrick has saved many cats and 

dogs with his bionic solutions, but he still faces new challenges every day. In tonight’s 
episode he is faced with two difficult cases that push his skills to the limit. (Part 3 of 4) 
(From the UK) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**  

 
9:30 pm Cats Uncovered – A Cat’s Eye View - Aloof. Disdainful. Vicious. Or friendly, fluffy balls of 

fur who just want to be loved. Opinions on cats tend to differ though one thing is sure - 
they occupy a very special place in the hearts of many. But how much do we really know 
about them? Making use of the latest bespoke technology, this fascinating and revealing 
series investigates every aspect of the lives of this often-misunderstood species. (Part 1 of 
3) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC    

 
10:30 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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Monday November 7th, 2016 
 
11:00 pm The World Game - Join the SBS football team for highlights and previews, plus the best 

action, news and exclusive interviews from around the football world. (An SBS Production) 
(Football/Soccer) CC   

 
11:30 pm Rectify - Back in Paulie, the Holden/Talbot family adjusts to daily life without Daniel’s 

catalysing influence. Janet stews and frets over Daniel’s life away from home until a 
chance encounter inspires her to take action. Teddy and Tawney attempt to reconnect. 
Amantha is confronted by someone from her past. Jared explores the great outdoors. 
Teddy, feeling antsy under his parents’ roof, makes Amantha an unusual offer. Unable to 
shake his sense of responsibility for Daniel’s case, Jon Stern continues to lobby Justice 
Row. (S.4 Ep.2) (From the US) (Drama Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**  

 
 MOVIE: 
12:25 am Gallants - Tiger and Dragon could defeat any opponent, until their master fell into a coma. 

Now they must protect their restaurant from encroaching gangsters, in this hilarious love 
letter to martial arts films. Directed by Derek Kwok and Clement Cheng, and stars Leung 
Siu-lung, Chen Kuan-tai and Teddy Robin Kwan. (From Hong Kong, in Cantonese) 
(Martial Arts) (2010) (Rpt) PG(V,L) CC   

 
2:15 am Room 101 - Poh Ling Yeow - Paul McDermott is joined by Poh Ling Yeow, a woman who 

made her name in the brutal world of competitive cooking where she was instantly loved 
by the Australian public. Australia’s most successful runner-up, Poh brings her pet hates 
to the Room 101 table. From serial face pullers, to stinky room deodorisers, and selfish 
sick kissing, Poh hopes Paul will make her world a cleaner, more natural, healthier place. 
(S.1,Ep.6) (Commissioned by SBS) (Entertainment Series) (Rpt) M(L) CC   

 
2:45 am 24 Hours In Emergency - Boys Don't Cry - This award-winning series continues with an 

episode focusing on men and boys who find themselves in emergency on the same day. 
16-year-old Max is brought to King’s by air ambulance from after falling 14 feet onto his 
face at a skate park. He suffered a serious head injury and was motionless for about thirty 
seconds after the accident. As Max’s parents, Steve and Tracey, are rushed to hospital in 
a police car, doctors need to ensure that Max is stable before they take him to CT. 
(S.5,Ep.8) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
3:40 am 24 Hours In Emergency - Throw Of The Dice - Filmed around the clock at King’s 

College Hospital in south London, this award-winning series continues with an episode 
which reveals how emergency is somewhere that wisdom and insight is passed just only 
from medic to medic, but also from generation to generation. 15-year-old Linden is 
brought to A&E having badly cut his leg while back flipping off a shed roof onto a 
trampoline. As well as calling an ambulance, Linden’s friends filmed the accident on their 
mobile phones and happily show the clip to A&E staff. But Linden’s mum Liz is less 
impressed and worries whether her son will ever learn to be more careful. (S.5,Ep.9) 
(From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
4:40 am SBS Flashback - Flashback on Tales from a Suitcase – Karima Haroon is an 

exuberant young woman from Afghanistan who arrived in Australia in 1999 as a refugee. 
Tragic circumstances have forced her to take charge and care of her entire family. (An 
SBS Production) (From Australia) (Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:55 am Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook Melbourne Bitesize - Passionate food creator and 

writer, Rachel Khoo, uncovers Melbourne and the wider state of Victoria’s culinary 
wonders for the world to see. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC    
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Tuesday November 8th, 2016 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Searching For Sugarman - In the late ‘60s, a musician was discovered in a Detroit bar by 

two celebrated producers who were struck by his soulful melodies and prophetic lyrics. 
They recorded an album that they believed was going to secure his reputation as one of 
the greatest recording artists of his generation. In fact, the album bombed and the singer 
disappeared into obscurity amid rumours of a gruesome on-stage suicide. But a bootleg 
recording found its way into apartheid South Africa and, over the next two decades, it 
became a phenomenon. Two South African fans then set out to find out what really 
happened to their hero. Their investigation led them to a story more extraordinary than 
any of the existing myths about the artist known as Rodriguez. This is a film about hope, 
inspiration and the resonating power of music. (From the US) (Documentary) M(L) CC   

 
3:35 pm Shackleton: Death Or Glory - Beyond Endurance - Following the successful sea 

crossing from Elephant Island, Tim Jarvis must now traverse the mountains of South 
Georgia to complete his re-enactment of Shackleton's 'double'. But injury, illness and bad 
weather are against him as his team shrinks to just three, leaving Tim, Royal Marine Baz 
Gray and sailor Paul Larsen to finish the job. Racing through a narrow weather window, 
and without a proper support team, they battle high winds, bad visibility, deadly crevasse 
fields and impossible climbs to finally reach their goal, Stromness, and walk back to a 
hero's welcome. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Final) (Rpt) PG CC   
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Tuesday November 8th, 2016 
 
4:30 pm Wild Italy - From the Alps To Tuscany - From the snow-covered Dolomites to the 

turquoise blue of the Mediterranean Sea, the spectacular landscape of Italy is already a 
favourite for many. There's a lot more to Bella Italia than meets the eye: a wilder, secretive 
side. Wild Italy displays the natural world between the tip of her boot and her northern 
Apline peaks in captivating pictures. In this episode, ice and snow rule over northern Italy 
in winter. Only specialists can live in the high mountains. As soon as spring arrives, melt 
water plummets down from the Dolomites into the valley. (Part 1 of 2) (From Germany, in 
English) (Documentary Series) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Ainsley Harriott's Street Food - Barbados - Popular British chef and author Ainsley 

Harriott travels the globe looking for new street food, finding adventure and great cooking 
on route. Tonight, Ainsley visits Barbados, and ventures off the beaten track in search of 
local delicacies. He prepares roti on the beach, fries fishcakes at a roadside stall and 
spices up a mango and sweet pepper salad with an exceptionally hot sauce. He also 
samples flying fish, barbecue pig tails, spiced lobster, rum-glazed chicken and grilled 
coconut-crusted sweetcorn. (S.1,Ep.2) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Who Do You Think You Are? - Geoffrey Rush - In the first episode of this series return, 

internationally celebrated actor Geoffrey Rush believes he hails from a long line of farmers 
but an exploration of his heritage sees him discover an ancestor fighting for justice in the 
face of corruption and another desperate to succeed in a golden age of creativity. 
Geoffrey can trace his paternal line back to his great, great-grandfather John Thomas 
Rush, the first of his ancestors to arrive in Australia. However, he knows nothing of this 
man’s earlier life in Ireland or why he came to Australia. What he uncovers is a David and 
Goliath battle in which his great, great-grandfather stood up for his rights and proved his 
resilience surviving the harsh beginnings and injustices of European Australia. (S.7,Ep.1) 
(Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
8:30 pm Insight - Australian current affairs forum, with lively debate and powerful first-person 

stories. Hosted by award-winning journalist Jenny Brockie. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
9:30 pm Dateline - A world of daring stories - Dateline is an award-winning current affairs program 

bringing you the unexpected from every corner of the globe. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
10:00 pm The Feed - Marc Fennell, Patrick Abboud and Jeanette Francis discuss the latest in news, 

technology and culture, adding a fresh perspective on the latest local and international 
headlines. (An SBS Production)   

 
10:30 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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Tuesday November 8th, 2016 
 
11:00 pm Resistance - Lili joins a new resistance group led by Fredo, a 21-year-old communist, 

who trains her to use guns, knives and grenades. The Kid is captured by the Germans 
and sentenced to death by firing squad. (S.1 Ep.3) (From France, in French) (Drama 
Series) MA(V) CC **New Double Episodes**    

 
12:05 am Resistance - Lili agrees to go undercover to transport a new resistance paper, Combat. 

Key members of the young communist group are arrested. When the prisoners are 
tortured, Lili is in danger of being discovered. (S.1 Ep.4) (From France, in French & 
German) (Drama Series) M(A,V) CC **New Double Episodes**       

 
 MOVIE: 
1:05 am Rapt - A rich businessman is brutally kidnapped and a ransom of 50 million euros is put 

on his head. But when secrets about his personal life begin to unfold, it causes his family 
to question whether his life is really worth the ransom. Nominated for four 2010 César 
Awards, including Best Film. Directed by Lucas Belvaux and stars Yvan Attal, Anne 
Consigny and André Marcon. (From France, in French) (Drama) (2009) (Rpt) M (L,V)   

 
3:20 am 24 Hours In Police Custody - The Drug Drop - This episode opens with a young man 

accidentally dropping a large quantity of cocaine from his jacket pocket outside a petrol 
station - all caught on CCTV. (S.1 Ep.6) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) PG CC    

 
4:15 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, Lebanese food in country 
NSW; Cantonese cooking; Barossa Valley food, wine and local produce; and a bamboo-
based meal. (An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:50 am SBS Flashback - In 1944, Stefania and her mother were transported first to Auschwitz 

and then to Bergen Belsen. Her mother perished in the concentration camp but Stefania 
survived the war and migrated to Australia in 1950. (An SBS Production) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Classical Destinations - Explore Europe's most fascinating cities and the classical music 

composed there. Aled Jones explores his Welsh homeland, his musical inspirations as a 
child, and the life of the Welsh composer William Matthias. (S.3 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm Dateline - A world of daring stories - Dateline is an award-winning current affairs program 

bringing you the unexpected from every corner of the globe. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
3:30 pm Insight - Australian current affairs forum, with lively debate and powerful first-person 

stories. Hosted by award-winning journalist Jenny Brockie. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
4:30 pm Peru: Extreme Planet - The Andes And The Altiplano - Cyril and Anne continue their 

journey in the Andes where they discover the most active tropical glaciers in the world. 
Reaching heights of more than 6,000 meters, these ice giants act as the water reserve for 
all of its surrounding regions. At this high altitude is also an extraordinary array of plant 
and animal life, including the astonishing puya plants, the Titicaca water frog and the rare 
Andean spectacled bear. (Part 2 of 2) (From France, in Spanish, English & French) G CC   
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5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Ainsley Harriott's Street Food - Reykjavik - Popular British chef and author Ainsley 

Harriott travels the globe looking for new street food, finding adventure and great cooking 
on route. Tonight, Ainsley goes to Reykjavik, where he finds a thriving street food culture 
at the docks, sampling rich lobster soup, salt cod, croquettes and crayfish bakes. He 
meets local chefs who are building up the country's culinary reputation with the finest 
seafood and prepares an Icelandic delicacy - langoustines in garlic butter with wholegrain 
mustard and honey. (Ep.3) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Hidden India - The hidden wonders of India's spectacular natural world are revealed by 

wildlife expert Liz Bonnin, actress Freida Pinto and mountaineer Jon Gupta. Experience a 
village of birds, masks that come alive, the world's greatest mountain range and baby 
turtles erupting out of the sand. This is truly a land like no other. (Part 2 of 2) (From the 
UK) (Class. tba) CC **Final Episode** **SBS Celebrates Diwali** 

 
8:35 pm 24 Hours In Emergency - Glass Half Full - Three-year-old Louie is airlifted to St 

George's after being run over by a car while playing outside his house. Doctors are 
concerned that his neck seems to be stuck in one position, which could indicate damage 
to his neck and spine. 14-year-old Josh arrives in resus having injured his ankle while 
riding a BMX with his dad on the front. 41-year-old Sam arrives in resus after losing 
control of her car and crashing into a tree. Dorctors are concerned about possible spinal 
and internal injuries. (S.8 Ep.12) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) M(A) CC 

 
9:30 pm Tutankhamun - 1918 - 1922. With the end of the war, Carter resumes his search for the 

lost tomb of Tutankhamun. He encounters Lord Carnarvon’s daughter, Evelyn, all grown 
up. They soon fall in love, but must keep their affair secret from her father. (Part 2 of 4) 
(From the UK) (Drama Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   

 
10:25 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
11:00 pm The Five - Pru puts herself in danger when she hits rock bottom. She finally realises it’s 

time to sort her life out before it is too late. Following Danny’s call for help from his friends, 
Mark is unnerved when he comes face to face with the evidence that will finally reveal the 
truth about Jesse’s disappearance. Marosi promises to lead Danny to the place he claims 
to have buried Jesse but a surprising discovery proves that Marosi may not have been 
working alone. (S.1 Ep.8) (From the UK) (Drama Series) M(A,V,L) CC **New Episode**   

 
 MOVIE: 
11:55 pm Omar - A young Palestinian freedom fighter agrees to work as an informant after he's 

tricked into an admission of guilt by association in the wake of an Israeli soldier's killing. 
2014 Oscar nominated for Best Foreign Language Film. (From Palestine, in Arabic & 
Hebrew) (Drama) (Movie) (2013) M(A,V,L)    
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 MOVIE: 
1:45 am White Night Wedding - As middle-aged professor Jon prepares to tie the knot with a 

student half his age, events conspire against him. His future mother-in-law is vehemently 
opposed to the marriage, his first wife won’t get off his back, and his best man is never 
sober for long. Jon begins to question whether love is enough. Winner of seven Icelandic 
Edda Awards in 2008, including Best Film. Directed by Baltasar Kormákur and stars Hilmir 
Snær Guðnason, Margrét Vilhjálmsdóttir and Laufey Elíasdóttir. (From Iceland, in 
Icelandic) (Comedy) (2008) (Rpt) M(N,S,L)   

 
3:35 am Knights - Men in Iron - A fierce warrior-class emerges in medieval Europe around 1000 

years ago: the knights. They live brutal lives, glorified by tales of chivalry and courtly love 
that have left us with a skewed idea of knighthood. In reality, it’s a world of freezing 
castles and violent battles, where joust competitions, fair maidens and the crusades are 
the latest fads. Manners and gallantry are everything and their abuse can end in deadly 
duels. This elegant and exciting 3-part series evokes the time of the knights in a unique 
and intimate rollercoaster ride of individual lives set in the wider context of medieval 
Europe. Their stories are told in gripping reenactments, illustrated by stunning CGI and 
explored with engaging documentary sequences. (Part 1 of 3) (From Germany, in German 
with English Subtitles) (Documentary/History) (Rpt) PG(V) CC   

 
4:40 am SBS Flashback - The plight of asylum seekers in the face of the Australian Government's 

policy of mandatory detention for 'unauthorised arrivals'. (From Australia) (Short) (Rpt) PG   
 
4:55 am Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook Melbourne Bitesize - Passionate food creator and 

writer, Rachel Khoo, uncovers Melbourne and the wider state of Victoria’s culinary 
wonders for the world to see. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Smart Secrets Of Great Paintings - The Painter's Studio By Courbet - The movie 

throws us at the heart of the Second Empire. A few years after the revolution of July, 
1848. Gustave Courbet offers his vision of the society through a critical realism 
denouncing the authoritarian power of Napoleon III. (From France, in English) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
2:30 pm Big Art - An art practice that engages with chance and coincidence and seeks to explore 

the deep beauties of the universe at work? Sounds tricky - so to turn that into Big Art takes 
enormous dedication to the most intricate processes at every stage of production - not to 
mention taking molten bronze well outside the safety zone. (S.1 Ep.6) (From Australia) 
(Arts) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) G CC  

 
3:00 pm SBS Flashback - Flashback on Everyone Loves a Wedding - The sequel: Sanjay and 

Keda. (From Australia) (Short) (Rpt) G   
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3:10 pm Tales From The Bush Larder - This series takes viewers on a tour of Kenya and her 

more unusual and unknown gastronomic delights. Hosted by Kiran Jethwa, a Kenyan born 
and internationally trained chef, has returned from a global gastronomic education to settle 
in the country he loves, Kenya. In this series, Kiran travels the length and breadth of 
Kenya to source rare and highly prized ingredients, primarily in the "bush larder", meeting 
diverse people from many different tribal backgrounds and exploring landscapes ranging 
from the highlands of Mount Kenya to the Lamu archipelago. (From the Netherlands, in 
English & Swahili) (Food Series) G CC   

 
3:40 pm The Sixties - The Assassination of President Kennedy (Part 2) - From the 

assassination of JFK, the Cold War and Civil Rights, to the moon landing and 
Beatlemania, The Sixties presents a unique view of this decade as it retraces the familiar 
and unearths the unknown. In this episode, prominent figures of the time trace the timeline 
of events leading up to that November day in Dallas, and try to explain why the 
investigations, media coverage, and personalities associated with the tragedy remain so 
compelling and controversial. (From the US) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
4:30 pm The British - Superpower - Britain's empire expanded through exploration and invention, 

as the Industrial Revolution transformed society and the economy - though the rise of 
mechanised factories was not welcomed by all. The advances of 19th-century technology 
aided the colonisation of Australia but also turned the Crimean War into one of the most 
brutal conflicts in military history. With contributions by Jessie J, Lily Cole and Dougray 
Scott. (Part 5 of 7) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG(A,V) CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Ainsley Harriott's Street Food - Reykjavik - Popular British chef and author Ainsley 

Harriott travels the globe looking for new street food, finding adventure and great cooking 
on route. Tonight, Ainsley goes to Reykjavik, where he finds a thriving street food culture 
at the docks, sampling rich lobster soup, salt cod, croquettes and crayfish bakes. He 
meets local chefs who are building up the country's culinary reputation with the finest 
seafood and prepares an Icelandic delicacy - langoustines in garlic butter with wholegrain 
mustard and honey. (Ep.3) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:35 pm Heston's Great British Food - Fish And Chips - Celebrity chef Heston Blumenthal is 

back with a brand new series where he explores the stories behind Britain’s favourite 
dishes. In tonight's premiere episode, Heston wants to reveal the incredible stories and 
discover the origins of British favourite, fish and chips. He travels from the Bluebell 
Railway to Brixham, Devon while recreating the typical fish and chip meal with his 
signature atypical Heston-style. Heston cooks up a tribute to memories of seaside 
holidays with an edible rock pool and creates a life like mussel, complete with edible shell 
and a lobster flavoured star fish, surrounded with other rock pool favourites - from edible 
sea sponges, to drinkable rock pool water. (S.1,Ep.1) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) 
G CC   
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8:30 pm Peter Kuruvita's Coastal Kitchen – Home Grown - Having bid farewell to city life and 

moved to the tropical seaside town of Noosa, chef and restaurateur Peter Kuruvita heads 
out to meet the community of passionate producers to discover more about the fresh local 
produce that has made this region one of the most exciting new foodie destinations in 
Australia. Since moving to the Sunshine Coast, Peter and his family haven't looked back. 
Peter begins his journey by visiting family-owned and run farms in the Sunshine Coast 
before transforming their produce into family friendly dishes, including his own Kuruvita 
family favourite, Pho, using Thai Basil picked from his own garden. (S.1 Ep.1) (From 
Australia) (Food Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Series Premiere**    

 
9:00 pm My Restaurant In India - The day of the soft launch has arrived but the restaurant is still 

under construction. The money has run out and the restaurant must open despite delays 
and systems not being in place. With untrained floor staff and over a hundred hungry 
guests, Sarah must push through fear and self-doubt to stay in control. (S.1 Ep.4) (From 
Australia) (Food Series) G CC **New Episode** 

 
9:30 pm Outlander - The Gathering - As the castle prepares for the Gathering, Claire plots her 

escape. But, after a dangerous encounter with a drunken Dougal and an unexpected run-
in with Jamie, her plans are dashed. (S.1 Ep.4) (From the UK, in English & Gaelic) (Drama 
Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**  

 
10:30 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
11:00 pm Sex Toys: Frisky Business – Burlesque - The erotic Fifty Shades of Grey novels 

captured the imagination of men and women worldwide. At the sex toy warehouse, 
demand for bondage gear has gone through the roof. A long-awaited delivery of whips 
and spankers from China finally arrives. But it’s covered in mould. With the company keen 
to capitalise on our passion for bondage, they launch a vintage range based on 50’s pin 
up model Bettie Page. It’s up to the women in the content team to flog the retro gear, so 
writer Jess heads to a tattoo convention in London to try and drum up trade. But will 
shoppers be willing to buy bondage gear in public? (From the UK) (Documentary Series) 
(Rpt) MA(S)   

 
 MOVIE: 
12:00 am Sex and Drugs and Rock and Roll - This is the true story of Ian Dury, who was 

diagnosed with polio at a young age and defied all expectations by becoming one of the 
founding members of the punk-rock scene in Britain in the 1970s. (From the UK) (Movie) 
(Biography) (2010) (Rpt) MA(D,L)   

 
2:05 am Restaurant Man - Desi Fusion - Coventry mother of ten Nahida is used to cooking  for 

big numbers, so she has decided that opening a  restaurant offering the same tasty Asian 
fusion food she cooks at home will allow her to make money from what she does best. But 
with no business plan, no grip on her finances and no intention of asking  for help despite 
keeping her full-time job as a social worker, naïve Nahida may see her restaurant  
become one of the many that fail before opening. Russell has his work cut out for him as 
he tries to get through to headstrong Nahida on everything  from her unusual restaurant 
design to the menu and how to market the business. (S.1,Ep.5) (From the UK) (Rpt) PG 
CC   
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3:10 am The Island With Bear Grylls - The men are radically losing weight, existing on a paltry 

average of just 300 calories a day. With their very survival hanging in the balance, the 
castaways lose patience with those they feel are not pulling their weight. Island life is 
taking its toll especially on the youngest castaway, 21 year old call centre worker Ryan, 
who has become exhausted and isolated from the group. In harsh unforgiving heat, Ryan 
heads off alone in the search of food. But without a supply of water he soon finds himself 
lost and in imminent danger. Forced to take action, the men form a search party - taking 
vital manpower away from the hunt for food. With Ryan’s actions now affecting the whole 
group, the men have a choice. Do they bring him back into the fold? Or do they cast him 
out? (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M (A,L) CC   

 
4:05 am The British - Revolution - During the reign of the Tudor and Stuart monarchs England 

became one of the world's leading naval powers and Henry VIII's began his feud with the 
Catholic Church. Contributors including Helen Mirren and Ben Kingsley discover how 
literature from the period sowed the seeds of revolution, and why a riot organised from a 
prison cell laid the foundations for civil war. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG(A,V) 
CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Characters Of Broome - Donnelly McKenzie - The two-part series about the characters 

of Broome will showcase the story of Donnelly McKenzie and Dianne Appleby. Donnelly 
McKenzie is a quiet gentleman of Broome who had his humble beginnings working at 
Streeter and Male and became the town's top sorter and grader of pearls. He was also a 
great sportsman, excelling at football, basketball and darts. He's got some charming and 
not-so-charming stories, especially of before the 1967 referendum, at which time Broome 
lived as a segregated community. Later in life Donnelly befriended Joe Roe, and started a 
counselling service called Pinakarra, and now lives a quiet, retired life with children and 
grandchildren. (Part 1 of 2) (From Australia) (NITV) (Documentary Series) G CC **NITV 
Encore** 
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2:30 pm Characters Of Broome - Dianne Appleby - Dianne Appleby is from the famous Broome 

family of the Edgars. Although she lives a contemporary life, Di Values the importance of 
language and culture. She is a linguist and is a fluent speaker in two languages: her 
mother's and father's, Karrajarri and Yawuru. Along with her mother Doris, Di regularly 
performs the Welcome to Country ceremony at Broome’s major events and was 
instrumental in establishing the Yawuru language classes at the Cable Beach Primary 
School. Di currently works for the Department of Corrective Services while supporting 
community organizations and the continuation and strengthening of the local language 
and culture. (Part 2 of 2) (From Australia) (NITV) (Documentary Series) G CC **NITV 
Encore** 

 
3:00 pm The Point Review - NITV National News features the rich diversity of contemporary life 

within Aboriginal and Torres Strait Islander communities, broadening and redefining the 
news and current affairs landscape. (An NITV Production)   

 
3:30 pm Heston's Mission Impossible - British Airways - Heston Blumenthal joins forces with 

British Airways to revolutionise airline food, but he soon realises that cooking gourmet fare 
in a metal tube at 37,000 feet is not going to be easy. (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) 
G CC   

 
4:25 pm Who Do You Think You Are? - Matthew Pinsent - Olympic rower Matthew Pinsent 

travels to China, where he finds out about his maternal great grandfather's connection 
with trading company Jardine Matheson and its link with an infamous trade. Back in the 
UK, Matthew traces his maternal line family back to some of the biggest characters in 
British history. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Ainsley Harriott's Street Food - Osaka - Popular British chef and author Ainsley Harriott 

travels the globe looking for new street food, finding adventure and great cooking on 
route. Tonight, the world tour moves on to Osaka, Japan, birthplace of the sushi conveyor 
belt and the pot noodle. Ainsley prepares local pancake delicacy okonomiyaki, oyster 
tempura and udon noodles with chilli prawns and peanuts, and visits a restaurant that 
specialises in raw chicken, before exploring the grills of the city's Korean district. 
(S.1,Ep.4) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Wild Sri Lanka - Coast Of Giants - A journey from the deep ocean to the shore, 

exploring how natural forces have shaped Sri Lanka itself, and the species that live along 
the coast and in the seas that surround this island. (Part 3 of 3) (From Austria, in English) 
(Documentary Series) G CC **Final Episode** 
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MOVIE: 

8:30 pm Tinker Tailor Soldier Spy - In 1970s England the head of MI6, Control dispatches an 
agent to meet with a Hungarian general who knows the idenitty of a Soviet spy in the 
organisation's ranks. However, the misison goes wrong and the general dies before he 
can reveal the information. Undersecretary Oliver Lacon calls veteran agent George 
Smiley back from forced retirement to ferret out the mole and stop the flow of vital British 
secrets to the Russians. Stars Gary Oldman, John Hunt, Mark Strong, Simon McBurney. 
(From the US, in English & Russian) (Thriller) (Movie) (2011) MA(V) CC **Premiere** 
**Spies And Lies Season**  

 
10:50 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
 MOVIE: 
11:20 pm Viva Riva - Riva is a small time criminal who has just returned to his hometown in the 

Congo with a major score: a fortune in hijacked gasoline. With wads of cash, Riva spends 
his time entranced by a beautiful girl he meets in a nightclub and escaping a relentless 
crime lord who is searching for his stolen gasoline. This vibrant film won awards around 
the world, and brings the city of Kinshasa to life on the screen as a mix of lawless 
shantytowns, bordellos and nightclubs. Directed by Djo Munga and stars Patsha Bay, 
Manie Malone and Diplome Amekindra. (From the Congo, in French and Lingala) (Drama) 
(2010) (Rpt) MAV(V,S)   

 
1:10 am The Young Montalbano - Back to the Roots - Resigned to the end of the romance with 

his girlfriend Mery, Montalbano throws himself into work, but he is soon shaken by the 
arrival of the new deputy inspector of Vigata, the young Domenico Augello, which brings 
with it a certain uneasiness. Later, at a traditional picnic in the square, a child is kidnapped 
and Montalbano is called in to investigate. Stars Michele Riondino. (From Italy, in Italian) 
(Drama Series) (Part 3 of 6) (Rpt) M (V,L)   

 
3:15 am Medieval Lives: Birth, Marriage, Death - A Good Death - The people of the Middle 

Ages didn't have the luxury of avoiding thoughts of death: it was always close at hand, for 
young and old, rich and poor, even before the horrors of the Black Death. However, it 
wasn't an end but a doorway to everlasting life. The Church taught that an eternity spent 
in heaven or hell was much more important than this life's fleeting achievements. As 
historian Helen Castor reveals, how to be remembered  shaped not only the worship of 
the people of the Middle Ages but the very buildings and funding of the medieval Church 
itself. (Part 3 of 3) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
4:20 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, a visit to Port Douglas; 
Malaysian sweet delights; Chinese fairy floss; and a trip to the Adelaide central markets 
with a Greek chef. (S.3 Ep.3) (An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:55 am Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook Melbourne Bitesize - Passionate food creator and 

writer, Rachel Khoo, uncovers Melbourne and the wider state of Victoria’s culinary 
wonders for the world to see. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This episode checks out the sustainable small businesses 

looking after the environment, including the father-daughter team making recyclable and 
sustainable furniture. Grab some dessert with Serendipity, an ice cream company hwo cut 
80 percent of their carbon emissions by switching to 100 percent green energy, and visit a 
cafe trading fresh fruit and vegetables to pickle. Ricardo also speaks to Ronnie Khan, 
founder of one of Australia's most successful social enterprises Oz Harvest, and heads to 
Canberra to explore how some homes are buying and selling spare energy. (S.1 Ep.15) 
(An SBS Production) (Documentary Series) (Class. tba) CC **Encore**      

 
2:30 pm Figure Skating: Isu Grand Prix Canada Pairs And Women - Coverage of the ISU 

Grand Prix Canada Figure Skating featuring the Pairs and Women's competition. (Sport) 
(Ice Skating)    

 
3:30 pm FIFA World Cup 2018 Magazine - This magazine program reports on Russia's 

preparations for the 2018 FIFA World Cup, including details of venues and regions, along 
with a look at football in Russia in general. (Football) CC   
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4:00 pm Cycling: Voxwomen - The Voxwomen Cycling Show is an all-new cycling show created 

exclusively by women that puts female riders in the spotlight, with racing news, tips and 
behind the scenes insight. (Sport) (Cycling) CC   

 
4:30 pm Lost Kingdoms Of Central America - The People Who Greeted Columbus - The Taino 

people of the Caribbean were the first people of the Americas to greet Christopher 
Columbus. But as Dr Jago Cooper reveals, the Taino had an amazing multicultural society 
complete with drug infused rituals, strange skulls and amazing navigation. In deep 
caverns and turquoise seas Jago uncovers their hidden history. (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Archaeology) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Tea And Coffee Trails With Simon Reeve - The Tea Trail - In this 2-part series, 

adventurer and journalist Simon Reeve uncovers the stories behind the nation's favourite 
drinks. While we drink millions of cups of the stuff each day, how many of us know where 
our tea actually comes from? From Mobassa, Kenya, Simon follows the tea trail, through 
the epic landscapes of Kenya and Uganda and learns that the industry that supplies our 
everyday cuppa is not immune to the troubles of the continent - poverty, low wages and 
child labour. (From the UK) (Documentary series) (Rpt) PG(V,A) CC 

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:35 pm Treasures Of Ancient India - Of Gods And Men - In a journey across the southern 

Indian state of Tamil Nadu, Sona Datta traces the development of the Hindu religion from 
its origins as an amalgamation of local faith traditions to its dominant position today. She 
uncovers this fascinating tale by looking at the buildings in which the faith evolved, moving 
from the caves and rock temples on the shores of the Bay of Bengal at Mahabalipurem, 
through the monolithic stone temple at Tanjavur to the vast complex of ornately carved 
towers, tanks and courtyards at Madurai, where every evening the god Shiva processes 
round the precincts to visit the bedchamber of his partner Parvati. (Part 3 of 3) (From the 
UK) (Documentary Series) PG CC **Final Episode** **SBS Celebrates Diwali**   

 
 MOVIE: 
8:30 pm True Grit - A powerful story of vengeance and valour set in an unforgiving and 

unpredictable frontier where justice is simple and mercy is rare. Mattie Ross, is 
determined to avenge her father's blood by capturing Tom Chaney, the man who shot and 
killed him for two pieces of gold. Just fourteen, she enlists the help of Rooster Cogburn, a 
one-eyed, trigger-happy U.S. Marshall with an affinity for drinking and hardened Texas 
Ranger LaBoeuf to track the fleeing Chaney. Directed by Ethan and Joel Coen, and stars 
Jeff Bridges, Matt Damon and Hailee Steinfeld. (From the US) (Western) (2010) (Rpt) 
M(V) CC   

 
10:30 pm First Contact - Ray Martin takes six outspoken Aussies into Aboriginal Australia for the 

first time. The six participants are brought to the heart of Aboriginal Australia - Uluru. 
Waiting for the group is award winning journalist, Ray Martin. Ray reveals to the group 
that they will spend the next 24 hours hosted by Aboriginal families in a place where more 
Indigenous people live than just about anywhere else in Australia – Sydney. The 
outspoken Aussies have their views challenged on everything from welfare to Aboriginal 
identity. (Part 1 of 3) (Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   
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11:30 pm First Contact - The group arrives on Elcho Island where around 2,500 Aboriginal people 

live in some of the most deprived conditions in the western world. The six are shocked but 
in amongst the helplessness, there’s hope. Next in Alice Springs, Ray Martin directs the 
travellers to join a night patrol service which helps the drunk and vulnerable. It’s not long 
before tempers flare. Emotions are then pushed to the limit as the group meet women 
struggling with addiction and share their own life traumas. For one of the six, the journey 
into Aboriginal Australia becomes all too much to take… Next stop is the Pilbara where a 
very different side of the mining business will be revealed. (Part 2 of 3) (Commissioned by 
SBS) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
12:30 am First Contact - After almost three weeks immersed into Aboriginal Australia, the group is 

about to face their most confronting experience yet. They are taken to Roebourne 
Regional Prison to discover what life is like on the inside. Coming face to face with 
Aboriginal prisoners splits the group in two. Ray Martin arrives at the prison and the final 
leg of the journey begins. The destination is Fitzroy Crossing in the Kimberley – a town 
once ravaged by the horrors of alcohol, domestic violence and suicide. But that was 
before local Aboriginal women fought back to save their community. By journey’s end, the 
group is left to reflect on their epic adventure into Aboriginal Australia. (Part 3 of 3) 
(Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary) (Rpt)  M(A,L) CC   

 
1:35 am Rockwiz - Helen Croome & Jordi Davieson - Rock music's most famous faces continue 

to mix it with the best local trivia buffs. Host Julia Zemiro asks the questions and Brian 
Nankervis adjudicates over the mayhem. A special guest performer this week is legendary 
Australian blues/jazz singer Wendy Saddington. (Commissioned by SBS) (Entertainment 
Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
2:30 am Real Humans - Mimi’s condition has worsened and the Engman family discover 

something about her past. Petra goes to the police and Real Humans to destroy 
Florentine. Claes and Inger must fight fire with fire to save her. Meanwhile, Jonas 
continues with his plan to transfer his consciousness to his clone. To do so, he needs to 
ask Silas for a big favour. Jonas starts doubting David’s clone after a revelation from Bea. 
(From Sweden, in Swedish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)   

 
3:40 am Real Humans - Florentine’s future is being settled in court and Mimi, wracked with the 

virus, is called as a witness. Then, an unexpected person from her past appears in the 
courtroom. Kevin and a group of Real Humans youths decide to go to Hub Battle Land to 
destroy hubots. Meanwhile, Rick, who is armed, aims to do all that he can to defend Hub 
Battle Land from humans and Bea gets Roger involved in the search for the code. (S.2, 
Ep.10) (Season Final) (From Sweden, in Swedish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)   

 
4:55 am Rachel Khoo's Kitchen Notebook Melbourne Bitesize - Passionate food creator and 

writer, Rachel Khoo, uncovers Melbourne and the wider state of Victoria’s culinary 
wonders for the world to see. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC   

 
 


