
 

  

 
 
 
   

Program Guide  
Week 52                                                     

 
 
 

Sunday December 18th, 2016 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Live Premier League: Crystal Palace V Chelsea - SBS football reporter Lucy Zelic and 

SBS football analyst and former Crystal Palace player Craig Foster host SBS's live 
coverage as Crystal Palace take on Chelsea at Selhurst Park, London.   
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Sunday December 18th, 2016 
EASTERN STATES (NSW, ACT, VIC, TAS) 

 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
3:00 pm National Basketball League: Sydney Kings V Adelaide 36ers - Exclusive live coverage 

of Round 11 of the NBL 2016-17. Watch as Sydney Kings take on Adelaide 36ers at 
Qudos Bank Arena in Sydney. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**  

 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - Hosts Ricardo Goncalves and Whitney Fitzsimmons shine a 

light on the small business owners and innovators playing a vital role in Australia's 
economic growth. Small to medium businesses make up 97 percent of Australian 
businesses. Each week, the program features a mix of established businesses offering the 
screts to their success, those who have weathered financial storms, and those just starting 
out, and how you can turn your business idea into a reality. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Current Affairs) (Rpt) CC   

 
 
 

Sunday December 18th, 2016 
SOUTH AUSTRALIA 

 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
2:30 pm National Basketball League: Sydney Kings V Adelaide 36ers - Exclusive live coverage 

of Round 11 of the NBL 2016-17. Watch as Sydney Kings take on Adelaide 36ers at 
Qudos Bank Arena in Sydney. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**  

 
4:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - Hosts Ricardo Goncalves and Whitney Fitzsimmons shine a 

light on the small business owners and innovators playing a vital role in Australia's 
economic growth. Small to medium businesses make up 97 percent of Australian 
businesses. Each week, the program features a mix of established businesses offering the 
screts to their success, those who have weathered financial storms, and those just starting 
out, and how you can turn your business idea into a reality. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Current Affairs) (Rpt) CC   
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Sunday December 18th, 2016 
QUEENSLAND 

 
12:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
2:00 pm National Basketball League: Sydney Kings V Adelaide 36ers - Exclusive live coverage 

of Round 11 of the NBL 2016-17. Watch as Sydney Kings take on Adelaide 36ers at 
Qudos Bank Arena in Sydney. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**  

 
4:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
4:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - Hosts Ricardo Goncalves and Whitney Fitzsimmons shine a 

light on the small business owners and innovators playing a vital role in Australia's 
economic growth. Small to medium businesses make up 97 percent of Australian 
businesses. Each week, the program features a mix of established businesses offering the 
screts to their success, those who have weathered financial storms, and those just starting 
out, and how you can turn your business idea into a reality. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Current Affairs) (Rpt) CC   

 
 

Sunday December 18th, 2016 
NORTHERN TERRITORY 

 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Small Business Secrets - Hosts Ricardo Goncalves and Whitney Fitzsimmons shine a 

light on the small business owners and innovators playing a vital role in Australia's 
economic growth. Small to medium businesses make up 97 percent of Australian 
businesses. Each week, the program features a mix of established businesses offering the 
screts to their success, those who have weathered financial storms, and those just starting 
out, and how you can turn your business idea into a reality. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Current Affairs) (Rpt) CC   

 
1:30 pm National Basketball League: Sydney Kings V Adelaide 36ers - Exclusive live coverage 

of Round 11 of the NBL 2016-17. Watch as Sydney Kings take on Adelaide 36ers at 
Qudos Bank Arena in Sydney. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**  

 
3:30 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
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Sunday December 18th, 2016 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 
12:00 pm National Basketball League: Sydney Kings V Adelaide 36ers - Exclusive live coverage 

of Round 11 of the NBL 2016-17. Watch as Sydney Kings take on Adelaide 36ers at 
Qudos Bank Arena in Sydney. (Sport) (Basketball) **Live**  

 
2:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
4:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
4:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - Hosts Ricardo Goncalves and Whitney Fitzsimmons shine a 

light on the small business owners and innovators playing a vital role in Australia's 
economic growth. Small to medium businesses make up 97 percent of Australian 
businesses. Each week, the program features a mix of established businesses offering the 
screts to their success, those who have weathered financial storms, and those just starting 
out, and how you can turn your business idea into a reality. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Current Affairs) (Rpt) CC   
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Sunday December 18th, 2016 
ALL MARKETS REJOIN 

 
5:30 pm The Nazi Gold Train - There’s the whiff of a fantastic James Bond plot about it: in the last 

days of World War Two, an armoured train rumoured to be loaded with Nazi gold and 
stolen treasure vanishes somewhere in the Polish forest. Shortly afterwards the nearby 
castle Furstenstein is captured by the advancing Red Army while it is the middle of a 
major renovation to create a new HQ for the Nazi elite, complete with secret passages, 
tunnels and subterranean armament factories. Seventy years later, treasure hunters claim 
to have rediscovered this mysterious train hidden in one of these tunnels beneath many 
meters of bedrock and concrete. It seems unbelievable, and yet, could there be some 
truth in these incredible stories? (From Germany, in German) (Documentary) PG CC     

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm This Is Greece With Michael Scott - This final episode explores the Dodecanese 

Islands. After traveling through the islands, Michael ends his journey on the island of 
Symi. From Symi, he reflects on the Greece he has seen: a place at the edge of worlds 
and yet so often at the very centre of attention, fought over and occupied by many, but 
also distinctively Greek, somewhere you can escape the real world and simultaneously 
come face to face with some of history's hardest truths. (Part 4 of 4) (From the UK) 
(Documentary Series) G CC **Final Episode**  

 
8:30 pm Egypt: What Lies Beneath? - By using cutting-edge satellite technology, and both high 

res and infrared imagery, Dr Sarah Parcak and her team hope to be able to ‘see’ under 
the desert sands – and will attempt to use this new information to create the most 
comprehensive map of ancient Egypt ever seen. For the first time, using stunning data-
driven CGI, an ancient Egypt never before imagined, is brought to life in a cinematic 
adventure that could re-write our understanding of this ancient land. (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
10:15 pm The World's Most Dangerous Journey - World Exclusive: What would you risk for 

freedom? Dateline journeys through one of the world's most dangerous jungles, a route 
populated by drug traffickers, bandits and migrants searching for a new beginning. We 
attempt what no one has filmed before - migrants on the way to USA risking death, 
drowning, deadly snakes and drug traffickers in the search for a better life. (An SBS 
Production) (Rpt) CC   

 
11:25 pm The Hidden Side Of Google - With 66 billion euros in revenue by the end of 2014, 

Google is the richest search engine company in the world and has become ubiquitous to 
the point of being used as a verb. By being ever present in our lives, Google has got to 
know a lot about us. But how much do we really know about Google? How did the big 
teenager become a giant octopus, a data swallower who took the opportunity to sneak 
itself into so many practical and free services that have become a vital part of our lives? 
Search engine dominance, data privacy violations, tax avoidance, stressed out 
employees: gain an exclusive insight into the dark side of Google. (From France, in 
English & French) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) G CC  

 
MOVIE: 

12:30 am The Chef - Jacky thinks his problems have been solved when he scores a unpaid cooking 
job at a luxury restaurant. But the head chef is facing a crisis of his own, when the new 
owner tries to replace him. Stars Jean Reno. (From France, in French) (Movie) (Comedy) 
(2012) (Rpt) M(L)   
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Sunday December 18th, 2016 
 
MOVIE: 

2:00 am Carancho - Sosa is an ambulance-chasing lawyer who operates as part of a gang who try 
to swindle insurance companies with fake accident claims. Rookie paramedic Luján is 
blind to the scams, but when she falls into bed with Sosa, she is drawn into his violent 
world of shady dealings and non-existent ethics. Winner of four Argentinean Film Critics 
Association Awards in 2011, including Best Film. Directed by Pablo Trapero and stars 
Ricardo Darín, Martina Gusman and Carlos Weber. (From Argentina, in Spanish) (Thriller) 
(2009) (Rpt) MAV(D,V)   

 
4:00 am Strip The City - Tokyo Megaquake City - Tokyo is under attack from the Earth's most 

devastating forces with the threat of tsunamis from the East, mega-quakes emanating 
from miles below and an active volcano - Mount Fuji - to the West. How does the city's 
buildings and infrastructure survive the onslaught of a destructive mega-quake? This 
documentary looks beneath the city's skin to discover the engineering wonders and 
geological forces that make it possible. Stunning CGI animation peels back the glass off 
its skyscrapers and rolls up its roads to reveal the city’s secret of survival. (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) G CC    
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Monday December 19th, 2016 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Al Jazeera News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in English.   
 
2:00 pm Andrea Boccelli: Cinema - From the internationally famous Dolby Theater in the heart of 

Hollywood, Andrea Bocelli pays musical tribute to the silver screen in a lush concert of 
beloved songs from the movies. Joined by Grammy-winning producer David Foster, the 
renowned tenor performs memorable favorites from blockbuster classics including The 
Godfather, Scent of a Woman, Dr. Zhivago, Once Upon a Time in America, Breakfast at 
Tiffany’s and many more. (From the US) (Arts) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:30 pm Tales From The Bush Larder - This series takes viewers on a tour of Kenya and her 

more unusual and unknown gastronomic delights. Hosted by Kiran Jethwa, a Kenyan born 
and internationally trained chef, has returned from a global gastronomic education to settle 
in the country he loves, Kenya. In this series, Kiran travels the length and breadth of 
Kenya to source rare and highly prized ingredients, primarily in the "bush larder", meeting 
diverse people from many different tribal backgrounds and exploring landscapes ranging 
from the highlands of Mount Kenya to the Lamu archipelago. (From the Netherlands, in 
English & Swahili) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   
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Monday December 19th, 2016 
 
4:05 pm Coasts Of Ireland - Belfast And The North - With over 1500 kilometres of impressive 

cliffs, stunning natural beauty, and traditional lifestyles, Ireland is truly the Emerald Isle. 
From the traditional pubs in Dublin to the friendly dolphin of Dingle Harbour, from the 
sturdy Connemara horses and tiny Rathlin Island to the Titanic's sister ship in Belfast, this 
series takes a very personal look at the country and people of Ireland. (Final) (From 
Germany & Ireland, in German) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:00 pm Living Black - Saving The Burrup - Traditional owners, lawyers, scientists and MPs in 

WA are united in opposition to changes to laws redefining what constitutes a sacred site. 
Hosted by Karla Grant. (S.23 Ep.1) (An SBS/NITV Production) (Rpt) CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rick Stein's Taste Of Italian Opera - In this colourful special, top chef Rick Stein takes a 

lighthearted look at the role that food played in the creation of Italian opera and shows 
how music and food are intrinsically linked in Italy. He draws parallels between cooking 
and composing, noting how both involve the skilful combination of ingredients and how 
they share the common purpose of bringing pleasure to many and lifting the human spirit. 
Rick also explains why he thinks the music of three great Italian composers - Verdi and 
Rossini - is connected to the food of the regions where they lived and worked. (From the 
UK) (Food) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm The Supervet – Christmas - The staff are always full of festive cheer at Christmas. But 

for Professor Noel Fitzpatrick, it's busier than ever. Adam, a sleigh pulling Alaskan 
malamute needs both knees replacing with implants. But as he is recovering from his first 
operation, Adam's other knee begins to fail, and owners Colin and Andrea are forced to 
make a difficult decision: wait for the first knee to recover fully and risk losing everything if 
Adam's second knee fails, or go ahead and let Noel operate on Adam's second knee 
within two weeks of having the first one done, knowing that the two-year old Malamute 
may not recover from having two knee replacements in quick succession. (S.3 Ep.9) 
(From the UK) (Documentary Series) PG CC **New Episode**    

 
8:30 pm O J Simpson: Made In America - OJ is acquitted of the murders, but soon many of those 

close to him begin to doubt his innocence. In the years that follow, he loses his fortune 
following a civil trial and is arrested and sentenced in an unrelated robbery attempt. (Part 
5 of 5) (From the US) (Documentary Series) M(N,A,V,L) CC **Final Episode**    

 
10:20 pm F-ck That's Delicious - Multiculturalism At Its Best - This series follows rap's greatest 

bon vivant, Action Bronson, as he travels the world meeting like-minded pleasure-seekers 
and eating his fair share of everything. Action stops in DC, Atlanta, and Miami, eats in the 
hottest restaurant in the country, samples true southern BBQ, and learns how to make a 
new bay scallop and papaya dish. (S.1 Ep.1) (From the US) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) 
MA(D) CC 

 
10:50 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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Monday December 19th, 2016 
 
11:20 pm The World Game - Join the SBS football team for highlights and previews, plus the best 

action, news and exclusive interviews from around the football world. (An SBS Production) 
(Football/Soccer) CC   

 
11:50 pm Rectify - Rectify follows the life of Daniel Holden (Aden Young) who returns to his small 

hometown in Georgia after serving 19 years on death row. Having spent his entire adult 
life in prison, Daniel must now try to find a way to cope with his past and forge a 'normal' 
life with an unexpected future before him. While doubts surround the circumstances of his 
original conviction, Daniel affects everyone he encounters in different and profound ways - 
his very fracture family, his community, and even strangers. (S.4 Ep.8) (Final) (From the 
US) (Drama Series) (Class. tba) CC    

 
 MOVIE: 
12:40 am Goemon - Based on a Japanese folk legend that echoes the tale of Robin Hood, this ninja 

thriller follows the exploits of Goemon Ishikawa, who leaves his fighting clan after its chief 
is murdered and uses his skills as a thief to help the poor. But after learning the identity of 
his leader's killer, Goemon sets out on a bloody path of vengeance. Nominated for two 
Asian Film Awards in 2010, including Best Visual Effects. Directed by Kazuaki Kiriya and 
stars Yosuke Eguchi, Takao Osawa and Ryoko Hirosue. (From Japan, in Japanese) 
(Action/Adventure) (2009) (Rpt) MAV (V)   

 
3:00 am Room 101 - Nazeem Hussain - The star of the SBS hit series 'Legally Brown', Nazeem 

Hussain, joins host Paul McDermott on Room 101. Nazeem not only pushes the 
boundaries of political incorrectness but also shares some very personal gripes. Whether 
it’s his pet hate of mirrors in gyms and his ‘skinny Sri Lankan calves’, to mechanics, to 
grumpy old people, Nazeem finds the fairest and funniest ways to persuade Paul to 
banish his pet hates into the Room 101 vault forever. (S.1,Ep.10) (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
3:30 am 24 Hours In Emergency - Family Matters - This award-winning series captures the 

dramatic and emotional stories of love, life and loss on the frontline of one of Britain’s 
busiest hospitals. It’s a busy Sunday at King’s as 23-year-old builder Jamie is rushed in by 
paramedics having fallen from the roof of a three-storey building, landing on a brick wall. 
The medical team discover a punctured lung that needs to be re-inflated. But the staff are 
there to comfort Jamie before his mum can be by his side with the rest of his family. 
(S.5,Ep.14) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(A) CC   

 
4:25 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, mud crabbing in the Gulf of 
Carpentaria; Colefax Chocolates shares the evolution of exquisite chocolate animals; the 
grain that makes the perfect pasta; and the secrets of Persian cuisine. (An SBS 
Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC    
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Tuesday December 20th, 2016 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Celtic Woman: A Christmas Celebration - Multi-platinum supergroup Celtic Woman put 

on a magical, winter wonderland concert with an enchanting mix of traditional Irish fare, 
contemporary songs, and original works by musical director David Downes (River dance). 
(From Ireland) (Arts) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm Trawlermen - The Great Prawn Hunt - This popular high energy, high adventure 

observational documentary series, follows the fortunes of crews who fish for everything 
from cod and haddock to prawns and monkfish, in some of the most dangerous waters 
around Britain. Tonight, we meet the crew of the prawn boat, Amity, in the grip of a winter 
storm, 180 km from shore. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Part 1 of 5) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:30 pm Aftershock: Hunt For Gravitational Waves - This is a story from the wild frontier of 

physics, where a small group of visionary iconoclasts dared to imagine a whole new 
picture of those vital first moments. It is a story of rejection, perseverance and professional 
courage that has culminated in one of the defining, and most disruptive, cosmological 
discoveries of our era: Gravitational Waves. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   
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4:30 pm Operation Maneater - Polar Bear - Mark travels to the shores of Canada’s Hudson Bay, 

where polar bears are causing havoc in isolated communities. He arrives in the town of 
Churchill hours after an attack has left two people seriously injured and a bear dead. He 
joins the Polar Bear Alert team as they transport a captured bear by helicopter to a 
release site outside town. In the Inuit town of Arviat, Evans works with wildlife officers to 
test an aerial drone early warning system, a military grade ultra-loud speaker to deter 
bears, and a controversial experiment to place meat out on the tundra to keep bears away 
from town. (Part 2 of 3) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG(A) CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rick Stein's Taste Of Italian Opera - In this colourful special, top chef Rick Stein takes a 

lighthearted look at the role that food played in the creation of Italian opera and shows 
how music and food are intrinsically linked in Italy. He draws parallels between cooking 
and composing, noting how both involve the skilful combination of ingredients and how 
they share the common purpose of bringing pleasure to many and lifting the human spirit. 
Rick also explains why he thinks the music of three great Italian composers - Verdi and 
Rossini - is connected to the food of the regions where they lived and worked. (From the 
UK) (Food) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Who Do You Think You Are? - Greig Pickhaver - Iconic entertainer Greig Pickhaver, 

known for his comedic alter ego HG Nelson, investigates the leading characters in his 
family history. His search uncovers a great-grandfather, Samuel Rinder, who in the late 
19th century, made his fortune as a sheep trader in Bendigo. As a wealthy man Rinder 
spent much of his time and money at the racetrack, but as the economic recession 
loomed he resorted to fraud and became a wanted man. Greig also investigates a family 
secret that’s much closer to home. His childhood was dominated by his parents’ troubled 
marriage and a mother devoid of affection. For the first time, Greig investigates the events 
which shaped his mother’s life- discovering a woman he never knew. (S.7,Ep.7) 
(Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
8:30 pm The Mekong River With Sue Perkins - Sue Perkins makes an epic journey up the 

Mekong, South East Asia's greatest river, exploring lives and landscapes on the point of 
dramatic change. In this third episode, she reaches Laos, a poor country shaped by 
Buddhism and Communism. Gaining access to a massive dam project, Sue asks if the 
price of development is too high. (Ep.3) (From Wales, in English) (Documentary Series) 
(Rpt) PG CC   

 
9:35 pm One Born Every Minute – Perfect Fit - Tonight ex- lovers prove that you don’t have to be 

together to raise a family, first timers from Brazil are in it for the long haul and childhood 
sweethearts must put their squabbling aside. (S.6 Ep.2) (From the UK) (Documentary 
Series) M(A) CC **New Episode** 

 
10:30 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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Tuesday December 20th, 2016 
 
11:00 pm Lilyhammer – Tommy - Frank starts a wine business. Uncle Sal's nephew goes to Frank 

for help. Roar is in trouble in Rio. (S.3 Ep.5) (From Norway & the US, in English & 
Norwegian) (Drama Series) MA(S,L) 

 
 MOVIE: 
11:55 pm Dossier K. - Veteran director Jan Verheyen delves into the inner workings of the Albanian 

mafia in this tense, fast-paced crime thriller. Set in a grim and violent vision of Antwerp, a 
brutal gangland murder sparks a police investigation led by a pragmatic detective and a 
maverick lawman who are at odds about how to bring the killer to justice. Based on a 
novel by Jef Geeraerts, this film is the long-awaited sequel to the multiple award-winning 
The Alzheimer Case. (From Belgium, in Flemish & Albanian) (Movie) (Drama) (2009) (Rpt) 
MA(V)   

 
2:05 am 24 Hours In Emergency - Twilight - The award-winning series, filmed round-the-clock at 

King’s College Hospital in south London, continues with a moving episode looking at the 
start and end of life, as well as the joys and fears of living alone. 75-year-old Graham is 
brought in to A&E having been the victim of a random attack - he’s been stabbed in the 
neck with a pair of scissors by a stranger on his doorstep. Graham is also vulnerable 
because he suffers from schizophrenia. Meanwhile 89-year-old Pat, a former nursery 
nurse, arrives having been found at the bottom of her stairs with no recollection of how 
she got there. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

 
3:00 am 24 Hours In Police Custody - Age Concern - Several elderly people have been sexually 

assaulted in a graveyard. The police have a sample of an attacker's DNA from a previous 
crime scene, and arrest a young man. Will his DNA match? (S.1,Ep.12) (From the UK) 
(Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(L) CC   

 
3:55 am One Born Every Minute - In this episode, it’s a day to remember as fourth generation 

twins make an appearance on the delivery suite, a larger than life double act struggle to 
see the funny side of their extended labour and an expectant father is hoping for a boy. 
(S.5 Ep.11) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(A) CC   

 
4:55 am SBS Flashback - Lee Lin Chin takes a nostalgic journey through the SBS archives 

highlighting some of the best music shows SBS has produced. (From Australia) (Short) 
(Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Andre Rieu: The Christmas I Love - A lovely collection of standard Christmas carols and 

holiday-themed classical pieces performed by Andre Rieu and the Johann Strauss 
Orchestra. It’s an understated and enchanting collection of holiday music that captures the 
warmth and love of the season. (From Holland, in Dutch and English) (Arts) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm Mankind From Space - Mind-boggling data and CGI traces humankind's story from 

hunter-gatherer to dominant global species in this epic journey of discovery. Seen from 
the perspective of space, this shows the breath-taking extent of humankind's influence; 
how humans as a species have transformed the planet and produced an interconnected 
world of extraordinary complexity. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:35 pm Wild Poland - Huge wandering dunes on the Baltic, thousands of lakes in the dream 

landscape of Masuria, gigantic river systems of Biebrza and Narew, mystical primeval 
forests and the rugged crags of the Southern mountains: all of this is Poland. No other 
country in Europe has more square kilometres of national parks, so it is little wonder that 
many animals are still to be found here that have long since disappeared elsewhere in 
Europe: bisons and black storks, ruffs and elks. Wild Poland gives surprising insights into 
the abundance of flora and fauna of an almost unknown European country. (From 
Germany, in English) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   
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5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rick Stein's Cornish Christmas - The people of Cornwall are proud of the fact that they 

do things differently, and the Christmas celebrations in this beautiful part of England have 
their own unique flavours and sounds. Home for a while from his world-wide travel 
adventures, Rick Stein has a chance to enjoy Christmas in his beloved adopted county, 
where he joins in the ancient festival of Wassailing and cooks his own goose. (From the 
UK) (Food) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Tony Robinson's Wild West - How The West Was Won - This episode focuses on two 

of Tony's obsessions from his childhood love of Westerns - cowboys and gun slinging 
outlaws. It also asks the question, who were the real winners of the West? Tony starts by 
looking at the birth and relatively short life of the cowboy in American culture (they arrive 
post-Civil War in 1865 and are becoming redundant before the end of the century) and 
then focus on the lives of the famous outlaws, including Calamity Jane, Jesse James and 
Wild Bill Hickok. He also tells the story of the civilising of the West and the arrival of 
thousands of farmers who gradually took over the land and created the mid-Western 
mindset of modern rural America. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Part 2 of 3) (Rpt) 
PG CC   

 
8:30 pm 24 Hours In Emergency – Stiff Upper Lip – Eighty-five-year-old Maura is rushed into 

A&E after falling over during the night at home. Her son Mark and his family found her 
face down on her bedroom floor when they arrived to take her out for the day. Maura has 
pain in her back and medics are concerned that she can’t move or feel her legs. (S.8 
Ep.15) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) M(A,L) CC    

 
9:30 pm The Christmas Party: An Abba Tribute - This seasonal show features one-off 

performances of ABBA songs by some of the UK's best loved artists. Artists include major 
pop acts of the 21st century and well known faces from the world of TV. The show is a 
celebration of everything that made ABBA a global phenomenon, and even features an 
exclusive interview from band member Bjorn Ulvaeus, who shares his memories of ABBA 
especially for the show. (From the UK) (Entertainment) (Class. tba) **Christmas Special 
Premiere**   

 
10:25 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
11:00 pm Trapped - The weather is finally improving and the investigation team from Reykjavík 

arrives. They waste no time closing the case. In record-breaking time they manage to get 
a confession to both murders and are soon on their way back to the city. But sometimes 
things are just too good to be true. (S.1 Ep.7) (From Iceland, in Icelandic & English) 
(Drama Series) MA(A)   

 
12:00 am Trapped - Captain Carlsen agrees to work with the police. On the ferry, it transpires that 

one crew member is wanted by police all over Europe. He proves to be a difficult catch. 
(S.1 Ep.8) (From Iceland, in Icelandic & English) (Drama Series) M(A)   



SBS Program Guide – Week 52 (2016) 

 

 

Wednesday December 21st, 2016 
 
 MOVIE: 
1:00 am Tied - Based on a true story that shocked France, Tied explores the affair between banker 

Eduoard Stern and his mistress. Through sadomasochism and 1 million dollar gifts, this is 
the retelling of one of France’s most high profile affairs that ended with the ultimate crime 
of passion. (From France, in French) (Movie) (Drama) M(S,N,A,L)    

 
 MOVIE: 
2:25 am The White Ribbon - Strange events happen in a small village in the north of Germany 

during the years just before World War One, which seem to be ritual punishment. The 
abused and suppressed children of the villagers seem to be at the heart of this mystery. 
Winner of the Palme d'Or at the 2009 Cannes Film Festival. Directed by Michael Haneke 
and stars Christian Friedel, Ernst Jacobi and Leonie Benesch. (From Germany, in 
German) (Mystery/Crime) (2009) (Rpt) M(A,S)    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Rod Stewart: Merry Christmas, Baby - Legendary singer Rod Stewart celebrates 

Christmas with this live 2012 performance, featuring stars such as Mary J. Blige and 
Michael Buble. Enjoy 13 classic holiday songs, as well as an original track by Stewart for 
the occasion. (From Australia) (Arts) G   

 
3:00 pm Living Black - Finding Family - More than 50 years after she was taken from her family 

as a baby, Kamilaroi woman Elly Chatfield goes on an emotional journey in her search of 
answers, family, and ultimately, belonging. Hosted by Karla Grant. (An SBS/NITV 
Production) (Rpt) CC   

 
3:30 pm SBS Flashback - Children and their mothers were forcibly separated by a policy that 

designed to eliminate the aboriginal race. It took years for the government to acknowledge 
the wrongdoing and hurt caused. In 2008 Prime Minister Kevin Rudd delivered a historic 
apology speech to the stolen generations. (An SBS Production) (Entertainment Series) 
(Rpt) G CC   
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3:40 pm The Sixties - The Space Race - Astronaut and NASA Administrator Charles Bolden, 

astronauts Mike Massimino and Dave Scott, and Walter Issacson, Douglas Brinkley, Tom 
Wolfe, Andy Chaikin, and Tom Hanks describe the greatest adventure story of all time.  
The “giant leap” pushed the boundaries of exploration to an unprecedented frontier, 
inspiring inventions and imaginations around the world for generations. (From the US) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
4:30 pm Underground Britain - Northern England - In this episode, presenter Rob Bell discovers 

two incredible natural wonders in the Yorkshire Dales - a kilometre of caves encrusted 
throughout with waterfalls set in stone and one of Britain’s deepest potholes. Rob explores 
how new technology is making sense of the enormous cave system which links the two. 
Next up, Rob learns how Stockport’s unique geology made it an ideal location for building 
Britain’s largest World War Two air raid shelter. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) 
(Rpt) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rick Stein's Cornish Christmas - In the second part of his Christmas special in 

Cornwall, Rick Stein and his chefs use local ingredients to create a Christmas banquet for 
all his Cornish friends, including the famous comedian Jethro - an old friend who, when 
they were younger, was a serious adversary on the rugby pitch. With Cornish Christmas 
music and the occasional glass of Cornish beers and ciders, this is a festive feast 
guaranteed to get viewers in the best seasonal spirits. (Part 2 of 2) (From the UK) (Food) 
(Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:35 pm Heston's Great British Food - Afternoon Tea - In tonight's final episode, Heston gives 

the classic British afternoon tea a few very special twists, conjuring something the Mad 
Hatter himself would be proud of. Heston does his own take on the Victoria sandwich 
cake. Inspired by a visit to Wedgwood fine china manufacturers, he makes an edible cake 
stand out of sponge and adds some 'sandwich' cakes that look like smoked salmon and 
cream cheese, but are in fact sweet cakes made from Earl Grey sponge and blood orange 
pâté de fruit. For tea, Heston brews a Darjeeling and hedgerow infusion and cucumber 
sandwich tea leaves. There's also a sandwich casino inside a beautiful country house in 
Staffordshire, where the guests are able to eat the playing cards, casino chips and even 
the gambling table. And there's one last surprise, with a chocolate teapot that pours Earl 
Grey chocolate tea. (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
8:30 pm Peter Kuruvita's Coastal Kitchen - The final episode in the series looks to the future of 

farming and shows the way the food community in Noosa is leading the way. Peter meets 
the Queen Bee whose adopt-a-beehive program is helping solve the declining bee 
epidemic, a school with a kitchen garden and the king of permaculture who shows Peter 
what it takes to become self-sufficient. (Part 6 of 6) (From Australia) (Food Series) G CC 
**Final Episode** 
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9:00 pm Destination Flavour Down Under - New Zealand: North Island - Adam explores New 

Zealand’s North Island starting in the majestic kauri forests in the north. He visits 
Dargaville, the kumara capital of New Zealand, and then a kiwifruit farm in Te Puke. At 
Rotorua he is invited to a traditional Maori ‘Hangi’ and then joins an impromptu game of 
rugby. After visiting a farm running shorthorn cattle, Adam heads to the coast to 
experience another New Zealand tradition, the ‘bach’, a modest holiday shack. A dish of 
roast Shorthorn beef with kawakawa on the deck overlooking the ocean is a perfect end to 
his North Island trip. (Commissioned by SBS) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
9:30 pm Outlander – The Devil’s Mark - Claire and Geillis are on trial for witchcraft. Jamie 

manages to rescue Claire, but not before she discovers a secret about Geillis's past. (S.1 
Ep.11) (From the UK & the US, in English & Gaelic) (Drama Series) (Class. tba) CC 
**New Episode**   

 
10:40 pm Outlander – Lallybroch - Reunited, Claire and Jamie make their way to Lallybroch - 

Jamie's family home. Reality quickly sets in, and old wounds are reopened between Jamie 
and his sister, Jenny. (S.1 Ep.12) (From the UK & the US, in English & Gaelic) (Drama 
Series) (Class. tba) CC **New Episode**   

 
11:45 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   

 
11:55 pm Magnifica 70 - Manolo’s voodoo priestess is sure that Dora can cure his impotence. 

Rosalvo, Lucifer and Chang, Magnifica’s backers, decide the next film will be in Rio de 
Janeiro. Dora tries to talk Dario out of the robbery, but Walter will not hear of it. (S.1 Ep.3) 
(From Brazil, in Portuguese) (Drama Series) (Period) MA(D,V,S,L)    

 
 MOVIE: 
12:55 am The First Beautiful Thing - Bruno, a failed poet, has fallen into the dull role of trade 

school teacher and indulges in drug use to break the monotony of his empty life. Many of 
his problems can be traced back to childhood disenchantment with his beautiful but 
wayward mother. When she falls terminally ill, Bruno must face his childhood issues when 
he returns to his hometown to visit her. Nominated for six Italian Golden Globes, including 
Best Film. Directed by Paolo Virzì and stars Valerio Mastandrea, Micaela Ramazzotti, 
Stefania Sandrelli. (from Italy, in Italian) (Drama) (2010) (Rpt) M (S,L)   

 
3:05 am The Island With Bear Grylls: Women - The extreme conditions on the island are taking 

their toll on the 11 remaining women and they are now on the brink of starvation. They are 
living on an extremely low calorie diet, surviving on snails and limpets and scraps of 
scavenged yucca and coconut. With the need to find a protein-rich meal now critical, 
Lauren, Beth and Belinda venture into the island’s jungle interior to set animal traps. 
Lauren realises that if they are going to survive they will need to be more determined. And 
her sights are set on a pig. Their traps are a success and it could mean salvation for the 
women - if they can kill it. (S.2,Ep.4) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(S,L) 
CC   
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4:00 am The Island With Bear Grylls: Men - It’s been four days since the men trapped and killed 

a crocodile, and they haven’t been able to repeat their success. Most of the meagre meals 
they are eating are coming from cleaning facilities manager, Vic, who is the only member 
of the group to have mastered his improvised fishing rod. But the pressure of being the 
group’s main provider of food is getting to Vic, who feels he’s being taken for granted. 
When Will constructs a makeshift raft from all the plastic bottles washed up on the beach, 
Vic takes it out in pursuit of a proper fish supper. But caught in a fierce undercurrent, and 
heading for razor sharp rocks, Vic faces a life and death struggle. (S.2,Ep.4) (From the 
UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm The Last Leader Of The Crocodile Islands - Laurie Baymarrwangga was the 2012 

recipient of the Senior Australian of the Year award. At 97 years of age, she is the last 
fluent speaker of Yan-Nhangu language. (From Australia, in English & Yan-Nhangu) 
(Documentary) (Class. tba)    

 
3:00 pm The Point Year In Review 2016 - Stan Grant and the NITV team look back on 2016.  The 

Point goes beyond the mainstream news cycle to uncover Indigenous stories that matter. 
(NITV)  

 
3:25 pm Christmas Feast With Peter Kuruvita - Acclaimed chef Peter Kuruvita revisits his 

culinary adventures across the Pacific in search of the perfect blend of flavours for an 
Australian Christmas feast, which he creates at his idyllic family home on the Sunshine 
Coast. In this one-hour special television event, Peter embraces the spirit of summer as 
he guides us through stunning reefs in the Philippines, ancient fishing practices of the 
Cook Islands, the pristine lagoons of Aitutaki and the fascinating culture of Indonesia. 
Then back in his beautiful home on the Sunshine Coast, Peter happily prepares a unique 
and new kind of Christmas lunch with his family. (Commissioned by SBS) (Food) (Rpt) G 
CC   
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4:25 pm 12 Drinks Of Christmas - Brothers-in-law and drinking buddies Alexander Armstrong and 

Giles Coren choose the booze that will give them their Christmas spirit. From mulled wine 
and fizz, eggnog and sloe gin to brandy and Boxing Day hangover cures, together these 
12 drinks are the festive selection pack that will ensure their family's Christmas is full of 
good cheer. (From the UK) (Food) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Rick Stein's German Bite - Chef Rick Stein sets out on a German voyage with his usual 

appetite seeking out tantalising culinary gems. His journey is timed perfectly with the 
arrival of the new season’s herring on the north German coast and the harvesting of white 
asparagus. He also heads inland towards Dusseldorf and the beautiful Rheingau region 
where he meets up with his son Jack and introduces him to the family legacy in that area 
as well as to some of the German Steins. This trip is particularly close to Rick’s heart. 
Although he has always known he was of German descent, he knows very little of his 
German family - one thing he is sure of is he wouldn’t have the business he has today 
without them. (From the UK) (Food) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Wild Canada – The Heartland - The focus of this episode is the heartland of Canada, 

which presents many different landscapes and distinctive habitats: vast forests, rolling 
grasslands, countless lakes. To the European explorers who arrived here in the 17th 
century, the forests and prairies appeared to be pristine wilderness, shaped by nature 
alone. (Part 3 of 4) (From Austria, in English) (Documentary Series) PG CC **New 
Episode** 

 
 MOVIE: 
8:30 pm Kon-Tiki - The story of the legendary explorer Thor Heyerdal's epic 101 day, 4,300-mile 

crossing of the Pacific on a balsawood raft in 1947. Along with 5 adventurous 
companions, Heyerdal sought to prove his theory that it was possible for South Americans 
to settle in Polynesia in pre-Columbian times. (From Norway, in English) (Movie) (Drama) 
(2012) (Rpt) M(A,V)   

 
10:35 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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EASTERN STATES (NSW, ACT, VIC, TAS) 

 
MOVIE: 

11:10 pm Shame - In New York City, Brandon's carefully cultivated private life, which allows him to 
indulge his sexual addiction, is disrupted when his sister arrives unannounced for an 
indefinite stay. Directed by Steve McQueen and stars Michael Fassbender, Carey 
Mulligan and James Badge. (From the UK) (Film) (Drama) (2011) (Rpt) MA(N,A,S)   

 
1:00 am Romanzo Criminale - Set in a Rome in turmoil during the late 1970s, this powerful crime 

drama charts the bloody, brutal rise of three petty hoodlums as they attempt to gain 
control of the city’s underworld, and the efforts of an idealistic police inspector to stop 
them. In the series premiere, three childhood friends - Libano, Freddo and Dandi - make 
plans to take over Rome by getting involved in organised crime. As their power grows, 
police inspector Nicola Scialoja struggles to bring a halt to their schemes - and finds his 
efforts hamstrung by his own colleagues. Stars Francesco Montanari and Marco Bocci. 
(S.1,Ep.1) (From Rome, in Italian) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)  Saturday December 24th 

 
2:10 am RocKwiz - Emily Lubitz/Paul Dempsey/John Paul Young - Rock music's most famous 

faces continue to mix it with the best local trivia buffs. Host Julia Zemiro asks the 
questions and Brian Nankervis adjudicates over the mayhem. Special guests this week 
include singer-songwriter and guitarist for Aussie band Something for Kate, Paul 
Dempsey, the flame-haired front woman for Melbourne folk/pop outfit Tinpan Orange, 
Emily Lubitz, and the one and only John Paul Young. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) PG CC  Saturday December 24th 

 
3:15 am Italian Super Cup 2016: Juventus V AC Milan: David Zdrilic hosts live coverage of the 

Coppa Italia 2016, as Juventus take on AC Milan at Jassim Bin Hamad Stadium in Doha, 
Qatar. (Sport) (Football/Soccer) **Live**  Saturday December 24th 
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SOUTH AUSTRALIA 

 
MOVIE: 

11:10 pm Shame - In New York City, Brandon's carefully cultivated private life, which allows him to 
indulge his sexual addiction, is disrupted when his sister arrives unannounced for an 
indefinite stay. Directed by Steve McQueen and stars Michael Fassbender, Carey 
Mulligan and James Badge. (From the UK) (Film) (Drama) (2011) (Rpt) MA(N,A,S)   

 
1:00 am Romanzo Criminale - Set in a Rome in turmoil during the late 1970s, this powerful crime 

drama charts the bloody, brutal rise of three petty hoodlums as they attempt to gain 
control of the city’s underworld, and the efforts of an idealistic police inspector to stop 
them. In the first episode, three childhood friends - Libano, Freddo and Dandi - make 
plans to take over Rome by getting involved in organised crime. As their power grows, 
police inspector Nicola Scialoja struggles to bring a halt to their schemes - and finds his 
efforts hamstrung by his own colleagues. Stars Francesco Montanari and Marco Bocci. 
(S.1,Ep.1) (From Rome, in Italian) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)  Saturday December 24th 

 
2:10 am Raymond Blanc: How To Cook Well - Frying - Michelin-starred chef and restaurateur 

Raymond Blanc gives viewers a master class in basic cooking techniques. Over six 
weeks, Raymond will show us how to master essential cooking skills, including roasting, 
poaching, frying, slow cooking, baking and barbeque and grilling. Each program will 
showcase five delicious dishes that are created using one of these techniques. Raymond 
will bring all his passion, curiosity and expertise to the series as he shows the audience 
what happens when you use each technique. In this episode, Raymond explores the 
techniques of frying. (S.1,Ep.4) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC Saturday 
December 24th 

 
2:45 am Italian Super Cup 2016: Juventus V AC Milan: David Zdrilic hosts live coverage of the 

Coppa Italia 2016, as Juventus take on AC Milan at Jassim Bin Hamad Stadium in Doha, 
Qatar. (Sport) (Football/Soccer) **Live** Saturday December 24th 

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.  Saturday December 24th 
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QUEENSLAND 

 
MOVIE: 

11:10 pm Shame - In New York City, Brandon's carefully cultivated private life, which allows him to 
indulge his sexual addiction, is disrupted when his sister arrives unannounced for an 
indefinite stay. Directed by Steve McQueen and stars Michael Fassbender, Carey 
Mulligan and James Badge. (From the UK) (Film) (Drama) (2011) (Rpt) MA(N,A,S)   

 
1:00 am Romanzo Criminale - Set in a Rome in turmoil during the late 1970s, this powerful crime 

drama charts the bloody, brutal rise of three petty hoodlums as they attempt to gain 
control of the city’s underworld, and the efforts of an idealistic police inspector to stop 
them. In the first episode, three childhood friends - Libano, Freddo and Dandi - make 
plans to take over Rome by getting involved in organised crime. As their power grows, 
police inspector Nicola Scialoja struggles to bring a halt to their schemes - and finds his 
efforts hamstrung by his own colleagues. Stars Francesco Montanari and Marco Bocci. 
(S.1,Ep.1) (From Rome, in Italian) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)  Saturday December 24th 

 
2:15 am Italian Super Cup 2016: Juventus V AC Milan: David Zdrilic hosts live coverage of the 

Coppa Italia 2016, as Juventus take on AC Milan at Jassim Bin Hamad Stadium in Doha, 
Qatar. (Sport) (Football/Soccer) **Live** Saturday December 24th 

 
5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 

(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network. Saturday December 
24th    

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.  Saturday December 24th 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



SBS Program Guide – Week 52 (2016) 

 

Friday December 23rd, 2016 
NORTHERN TERRITORY 

 
11:10 pm Romanzo Criminale - Set in a Rome in turmoil during the late 1970s, this powerful crime 

drama charts the bloody, brutal rise of three petty hoodlums as they attempt to gain 
control of the city’s underworld, and the efforts of an idealistic police inspector to stop 
them. In the first episode, three childhood friends - Libano, Freddo and Dandi - make 
plans to take over Rome by getting involved in organised crime. As their power grows, 
police inspector Nicola Scialoja struggles to bring a halt to their schemes - and finds his 
efforts hamstrung by his own colleagues. Stars Francesco Montanari and Marco Bocci. 
(S.1,Ep.1) (From Rome, in Italian) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)   

 
12:15 am RocKwiz - Emily Lubitz/Paul Dempsey/John Paul Young - Rock music's most famous 

faces continue to mix it with the best local trivia buffs. Host Julia Zemiro asks the 
questions and Brian Nankervis adjudicates over the mayhem. Special guests this week 
include singer-songwriter and guitarist for Aussie band Something for Kate, Paul 
Dempsey, the flame-haired front woman for Melbourne folk/pop outfit Tinpan Orange, 
Emily Lubitz, and the one and only John Paul Young. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) PG CC Saturday December 24th  

 
1:15 am Raymond Blanc: How To Cook Well - Frying - Michelin-starred chef and restaurateur 

Raymond Blanc gives viewers a master class in basic cooking techniques. Over six 
weeks, Raymond will show us how to master essential cooking skills, including roasting, 
poaching, frying, slow cooking, baking and barbeque and grilling. Each program will 
showcase five delicious dishes that are created using one of these techniques. Raymond 
will bring all his passion, curiosity and expertise to the series as he shows the audience 
what happens when you use each technique. In this episode, Raymond explores the 
techniques of frying. (S.1,Ep.4) (From the UK) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC Saturday 
December 24th 

 
1:45 am Italian Super Cup 2016: Juventus V AC Milan: David Zdrilic hosts live coverage of the 

Coppa Italia 2016, as Juventus take on AC Milan at Jassim Bin Hamad Stadium in Doha, 
Qatar. (Sport) (Football/Soccer) **Live** Saturday December 24th 

 
4:30 am Food Lovers’ Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, an Iraqi kitchen in Victoria; the 
Rattlesnake Grill in Neutral Bay; Mrs Smith's Pies of Hobart; and a Dutch-Indonesian feast 
prepared by the Arona Christian community in Kuranda. (An SBS Production) (Food 
Series) (Rpt) G CC Saturday December 24th 

 
5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 

(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network. Saturday December 
24th    

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.  Saturday December 24th 
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Friday December 23rd, 2016 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 
11:10 pm Romanzo Criminale - Set in a Rome in turmoil during the late 1970s, this powerful crime 

drama charts the bloody, brutal rise of three petty hoodlums as they attempt to gain 
control of the city’s underworld, and the efforts of an idealistic police inspector to stop 
them. In the first episode, three childhood friends - Libano, Freddo and Dandi - make 
plans to take over Rome by getting involved in organised crime. As their power grows, 
police inspector Nicola Scialoja struggles to bring a halt to their schemes - and finds his 
efforts hamstrung by his own colleagues. Stars Francesco Montanari and Marco Bocci. 
(S.1,Ep.1) (From Rome, in Italian) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V)   

 
12:15 am Italian Super Cup 2016: Juventus V AC Milan: David Zdrilic hosts live coverage of the 

Coppa Italia 2016, as Juventus take on AC Milan at Jassim Bin Hamad Stadium in Doha, 
Qatar. (Sport) (Football/Soccer) **Live** Saturday December 24th 
 
MOVIE: 

3:00 am Shame - In New York City, Brandon's carefully cultivated private life, which allows him to 
indulge his sexual addiction, is disrupted when his sister arrives unannounced for an 
indefinite stay. Directed by Steve McQueen and stars Michael Fassbender, Carey 
Mulligan and James Badge. (From the UK) (Film) (Drama) (2011) (Rpt) MA(N,A,S) 
Saturday December 24th    

 
4:40 am Rachel Khoo’s Kitchen Notebook Melbourne Bitesize - Passionate food creator and 

writer, Rachel Khoo, uncovers Melbourne and the wider state of Victoria’s culinary 
wonders for the world to see. (Commissioned by SBS) (Short) (Rpt) G CC Saturday 
December 24th 

 
5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 

(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.  Saturday December 
24th 

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.  Saturday December 24th 
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ALL MARKETS REJOIN 

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Gwen Ifill and 

Judy Woodruff for the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Small Business Secrets - Hosts Ricardo Goncalves and Whitney Fitzsimmons shine a 

light on the small business owners and innovators playing a vital role in Australia's 
economic growth. Small to medium businesses make up 97 percent of Australian 
businesses. Each week, the program features a mix of established businesses offering the 
screts to their success, those who have weathered financial storms, and those just starting 
out, and how you can turn your business idea into a reality. (S.1 Ep.1) (From Australia) 
(Current Affairs) (Rpt) CC   

 
2:30 pm ISU Figure Skating - Coverage of the ISU Grand Prix Figure Skating China featuring the 

Pairs and Women’s competitions. (Sport) (Figure Skating) CC   
 
3:30 pm Cycling: Crocodile Trophy 2016 - Coverage of the Crocodile Trophy 2016, the annual 

mountain bike race held in North Queensland. (Sport) (Cycling)   
 
4:00 pm Cycling: L’etape Australia 2016 - Coverage of the L'Etape Australia by le Tour de 

France 2016. Expertly designed to replicate a stage of the Tour de France, participants 
will ride through the New South Wales Snowy Mountains. The ultimate challenge of the 
race covers 157 kilometres, which includes the difficult Col de Beloka and finishes with the 
demanding Col de Kosciuszko final climb. (Sport) (Cycling)  

 
4:15 pm Ernesto In The Land Of Football - It was never going to be easy for Ernesto being the 

new Argentine kid at school in football-crazed Brazil. But ultimately, it's his football skills 
that eases the taunts and makes new friends of his Brazilian foes. (From Brazil, in 
Portuguese & Spanish) (Entertainment) (Short Film) (2009) (Rpt) PG   
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4:30 pm Empresses Of Ancient Rome - Professor Catherine Edwards travels across what was 

the heart of the Roman empire lifting the lid on the women behind some of the most 
fearsome emperors of all time. These women were PR weapons and fashion role models, 
patrons and matchmakers, politicians and plotters. Everything from murderers to murder 
victims, and from pagan goddesses to Christian saints. We see that women could pull the 
strings of power too, but only at great personal risk. (Part 2 of 3) (From the UK) 
(Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Bon Appetit! Gerard Depardieu's Europe – Naples - In Capaccio, our travellers learn 

how to make mozzarella. On the slopes of Vesuvius, Antonio Tubelli shows them the 
friarielli: the fetish cabbage of Campania, and finally in Naples they discover pasta which 
has been manufactured since the 17th Century. (S.1 Ep.4) (From France, in French) PG 
CC    

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production)   
 
7:30 pm Secrets Of Britain - Secrets of Underground London - This series visits famous British 

buildings and  institutions to reveal its past and present, meeting a wide range of experts 
and historians along the way. The first episode explores the secrets of underground 
London. On the surface, London is a buzzing, modern metropolis - but underneath lies 
secret, hidden worlds, all but forgotten by the millions of people above. The program 
uncovers 2000 years of subterranean history: a world of ancient caves and perfectly 
preserved Roman remains; mysterious rivers and gruesome plague pits; impenetrable 
vaults and top-secret bunkers. (Part 1 of 6) (From the US) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
 MOVIE: 
8:35 pm The Adventures Of Tintin - From Academy Award-winning filmmakers Steven Spielberg 

and Peter Jackson comes the epic adventures of Tintin. Racing to uncover the secrets of 
a sunken ship that may hold a vast fortune - but also an ancient curse - Tintin and his loyal 
dog Snowy embark on an action-packed journey around the world that critics are calling 
“fun for the whole family. (From the US) (Movie) (Animation) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
10:30 pm The Christmas Party: An Abba Tribute - This seasonal show features one-off 

performances of ABBA songs by some of the UK's best loved artists. Artists include major 
pop acts of the 21st century and well known faces from the world of TV. The show is a 
celebration of everything that made ABBA a global phenomenon, and even features an 
exclusive interview from band member Bjorn Ulvaeus, who shares his memories of ABBA 
especially for the show. (From the UK) (Entertainment) (Rpt) (Class. tba) **Encore**    

   
11:25 pm The Legacy - Emil goes to Thailand to sell his resort. Frederik tries to rediscover passion 

with his wife. Andreas feels left behind by Signe's plans. (Final) (Ep.10) (From Denmark, 
in Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(D,A,S,L) CC 

 
12:35 am Mad Men - The Doorway (Part 1) - Don and Megan take a trip to Hawaii for the holidays, 

Sally's friend visits the Francis family, a comedian torpedoes Peggy's Super Bowl ad 
campaign, and Roger gets some bad news about his mother. (S.6,Ep.1) (From the US) 
(Drama Series) (Rpt) M(D,A,L) CC   
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1:30 am Mad Men - The Doorway (Part 2) - Don strikes up a friendship with the surgeon in his 

building, Peggy tries to save her campaign, Roger makes a scene at his mother's funeral, 
and Betty goes to Manhattan to find Sally's friend. (S.6,Ep.2) (From the US) (Drama 
Series) (Rpt) M(S,D,L) CC   

 
2:20 am Mad Men - Collaborators - While Don continues his affair with Sylvia, Pete's latest 

infidelity threatens his marriage. Meanwhile, Peggy's icy relationship with her new staff 
continues, but she also gets an unlikely tip on a potential new client. (S.6,Ep.3) (From the 
US) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(S,A) CC   

 
3:15 am Mad Men - To Have And To Hold - Don works in secret on a Heinz ketchup campaign 

while Megan gets a love scene on the set of her soap opera. Meanwhile, Harry makes his 
power play while Joan has more trouble with the secretaries. (S.6,Ep.4) (From the US) 
(Drama Series) (Rpt) M(D) CC   

 
4:05 am Mad Men - The Flood - Set among the events surrounding Martin Luther King's 

assassination, Peggy tries to get a new apartment, Ginsberg is set up on a date, and Don 
has a revelation during his weekend with the kids. (S.6,Ep.5) (From the US) (Drama 
Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 


