
 

Week 13: Sunday, 26 March to Saturday, 1 April, 2017  

 
 
Program Guide  
Week 13                                                   

                               
Sunday March 26th, 2017 

  
5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 

(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   
 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
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1:00 pm Strip The Cosmos - Alien Worlds - This episode uses stunning CGI to strip apart alien 

moons and planets – peeling away impenetrable smoggy atmospheres, icy crusts, and 
lakes of methane – layer by layer - to identify the secret to life elsewhere in the universe. 
Astronomers now think almost every star has  planets orbiting around it, creating billions 
of different environments in deep space. This epiosde dives to the deepest depths of our 
galaxy on the search of the places life could be hiding. Stunning CGI animation cracks 
open frozen moons blasting ice into space, reveals hidden oceans, and unveils the bizarre 
worlds where mountains are made of diamonds and volcanoes erupt with water. This 
program unlocks the secrets of the universe’s most alien landscapes, and reveals just how 
close we are to discovering that we are not alone. (Final) (Ep.6) (From the UK) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
2:00 pm Speedweek - A comprehensive motor sports program for speed enthusiasts. (Motor 

Sport) CC   
 
4:00 pm FIFA World Cup 2018 Magazine - This magazine program reports on Russia's 

preparations for the 2018 FIFA World Cup, including details of venues and regions, along 
with a look at football in Russia in general. (Football) CC   

 
4:30 pm Cycling: Incycle - All the latest cycling news and highlights from across the world. Hosted 

by Michael Tomalaris. (Cycling) CC   
 
5:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This week, visit the company bringing the world's first cold-

pressed milk to Australian supermarkets, and explore how a former soldier invented an 
affordable and compact emergency shelter for refugees and disaster victims. Take a walk 
through Fairfield, one of the most multicultural suburbs in Australia, with Fairfield Chamber 
of Commerce President Vince Movizio. (S.2 Ep.6) (Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary 
series) (Class.tbc) CC 

 
5:35 pm Nazi Megastructures - Lightning War Machine - In the first years of WWII, Hitler's 

Germany crushed its enemies in a series of lightning offensives. Extraordinary ruins 
scattered across Europe tell the story of a revolution in tactics and weapons which almost 
gives Hitler the chance to create his Thousand Year Reich.  S.3 Ep.2)(From the United 
States)(Documentary Series) PG (A) CC  

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:30 pm Britain's Ancient Capital: Secrets Of Orkney - Britain's Ancient Capital digs beneath the 

surface of the dazzling and mysterious Orkney Islands. Orkney might seem remote today 
but in the Stone Age these fascinating islands were a technological, cultural and spiritual 
hub. This documentary uses CGI technology, satellite imaging, drone photography and a 
robot submarine to bring history to life. (Part 1 of 3) (From the U.K) (Documentary Series) 
TBC **New Series Premiere** 

 
8:35 pm Cleopatra - This documentary lifts the lid on the murderous and incestuous dynasty that 

gave rise to Egypt's most famous ruler and how Cleopatra, through ruthless political 
manoeuvring, family betrayal and sensual seduction, endured Rome became her greatest 
protector. (S1. Eps.1 & 2) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Class. Tbc) CC **Premiere** 
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10:15 pm Lost City Of The Gladiators - This is the first discovery of an entire gladiator school with 

an adjacent cemetery for dead fighters recently found in Austria. Located in the former 
Roman imperial residence of Carnuntum, only a small portion of the large area has been 
explored - an area that was located on the important trade routes that connected east and 
west, north and south. At the collapse of the Roman Empire, the city was abandoned and 
no settlements were established, allowing researchers to study the period as it was. The 
gladiator school may not be the only treasure to be found on the site of the lost city of 
Carnuntum - there may be many, many more. (From Germany) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(V) 
CC   

 
  MOVIE: 
11:15 pm I Am Love - Over two decades ago, Emma left Russia to follow Tancredi Recchi, the man 

who had proposed to her. Now a member of a wealthy Milanese family, she is the 
respected mother of three. Although not unhappy, Emma feels confusedly unfulfilled. As 
cracks in the family façade appear, she is reawakened to the forces of passion and 
unconditional love. Directed by Luca Guadagnino and stars Tilda Swinton, Flavio Parenti 
and Edoardo Gabbriellini. (From Italy, in Italian) (Drama) (2009) (Rpt) MA (S) CC   

 
 MOVIE: 
1:20 am An Earthly Paradise For The Eyes - Director Irena Pavlaskova finds humour in the dark 

depths of the Soviet occupation of Czechoslovakia in this lively black comedy. The year is 
1968 and Marta is trying to raise her two teenage daughters - Majda and Gábina - as the 
Soviet tanks roll in. However, living with a constantly changing cast of their mother’s 
boyfriends, proves as challenging for the adolescents as surviving under the oppressive 
communist regime. Stars Vilma Cibulková,  Tereza Vorísková and Dana Markova. (From 
the Czech Republic, in Czech) (History) (2009) (Rpt) M (A,L,S,V)   

 
3:30 am Who Do You Think You Are? - Vince Colosimo - Actor Vince Colosimo was born and 

bred in Melbourne, and both of Vince's parents are from Calabria in the south of Italy. 
Vince remembers his late grandfather, Antonio Russo, but knows almost nothing about his 
life in Italy before he emigrated. As Vince discovers more about his grandfather, and his 
experiences in World War Two, he uncovers an episode of tragedy and a truly 
extraordinary story of survival. On his father's side, Vince sets off to find out more about 
his dad's mother, who died quite young. (Commissioned by SBS, in Italian and English) 
(Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
4:30 am Food Lovers Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, all there is to know about olive 
oil; the Melbourne restaurant scene; a third generation native Australian bee keeper; and 
a look at Sydney's Portuguese community. (An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G 
CC    
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Monday March 27th, 2017 
    

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
5:45 am France 24 Feature - News feature in English from France 24, Paris.   
 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm Al Jazeera News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in English.   
 
2:00 pm Andre Rieu: Under The Stars - André Rieu and his Johann Strauss Orchestra present a 

colourful concert under the star-studded summer skies. Once again, André transforms the 
Vrijthof Square in his hometown of Maastricht into a grand, romantic open-air concert hall. 
Special guests include the Harlem Gospel Choir and the Soweto Gospel Choir, along with 
a very special guest in the audience: Oscar-winning actor Sir Anthony Hopkins. (From the 
Netherlands, in English) (Entertainment) (Rpt) G CC 

 
3:05 pm SBS Flashback - As the melting pot bubbles away, many more Australians are choosing 

to marry outside their ethnic background. At no other time are cultural traditions celebrated 
with such passion as at a wedding. (S.1 Ep.5) (From Australia) (An SBS Production) 
(Entertainment Series) (Short) (Rpt) G CC   
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3:15 pm Predict My Future: The Science Of Us - When Genes Mix With the Wrong 

Environment - The Dunedin Study has identified a fundamental developmental 
mechanism that completely rewrites the nature versus nurture argument. It is a genetic 
switch which is thrown by life events - nature loads the gun but nurture pulls the trigger. 
This episode tracks the hunt for the mechanism using three specific examples - violence 
in men, depression, and cannabis induced schizophrenia. (Part 3 of 4) (From New 
Zealand) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
4:05 pm The Wonder Of Dogs - All Shapes and Sizes - This episode looks at the abilities of 

different dog breeds and the role humans play in developing them. Included in this 
episode are Cocker Spaniels; Pembroke Welsh Corgis and Hunting Breeds. (Part 3 of 3) 
(From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:00 pm Living Black - Narelle's Fight - Single mum Narelle Reynolds has two adult sons with 

fragile X syndrome, a genetic condition causing intellectual disability. We join Narelle and 
her family's struggles in a bid to save her son's life.  (News and Current Affairs) 
(Commissioned by SBS) (Rpt) (Class.tbc) CC 

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Food Safari Fire - This episode, Maeve explores Argentinian a la cruz style cooking, 

Brazilian churrasco, Sardinian suckling pig, Portuguese piri piri chicken and a crowd-
pleasing Greek Easter lamb. To begin, Maeve joins chef Nicolas Arriola, who 
demonstrates the dramatic asado a la cruz with a whole lamb butterflied and fixed to a 
cross-like structure over the fire. Then it's a feast of a Brazilian Churrasco with Brazilian 
expat and restaurateur, Patricia Nunes, who demonstrates how to make a delicious salt-
encrusted picanha. (S.1,Ep.6) (Commissioned by SBS) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:30 pm The Doctor Who Gave Up Drugs - Dr Chris van Tullenken has been trying to treat 

specially selected patients without drugs and wants to share what he's learnt with fourteen 
thousand patients at the clinic. The drug free clinic has an underwhelming launch, as Dr 
Chris learns that people would rather pop a pill than make lifestyle changes. Chris meets 
Crystal, who is taking 30 pills a day for her chronic back pain. Over five months and a 
dramatic withdrawal from her addictive meds, Chris leads her on an extraordinary road to 
recovery. (Part 2 of 2) (From the UK)(Documentary Series) TBC **Final Episode** 

 
8:35 pm Simon Reeve's Big Life Fix - Seven of the UK's leading engineers, designers and 

computer programmers put their skills together to try and help four people with very 
different needs. Mum of two Shamreen who has very limited vision needs something that 
will help her and her two young sons get around. Seven year old Rosie who had brain 
surgery as a baby and now wears a cumbersome medical helmet, hopes the team can 
make her a less visible helmet that will help her fit in with her friends and the team are 
challenged with coming up with a  solution to help two teenage brothers with cystic 
fibrosis. (Part 3 of 3) (From the UK) (Documentary series) (Class.tbc) CC **Final 
Episode** 
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9:40 pm SAS: Who Dares Wins - The series return sees Chief Instructor Ant and his elite team of 

Directing Staff take 25 new recruits deep into the Amazonian Rainforest to take part in a 
unique version of the jungle phase of SAS Selection. Selection is designed to find a 
unique kind of soldier for an unconventional unit. Physical fitness is no more than a basic 
requirement; what's really being tested is resilience and character. (S2. Ep1.) (From the 
UK) (Documentary series) TBC **New Season** 

 
10:35 pm The Feed - News. People. Culture. Daily. Your daily mix of news, interviews, in-depth 

features and comedy. Hosted by Marc Fennell and Jan Fran, The Feed brings you the 
stories and perspectives that matter. With reporting from Patrick Abboud and Laura 
Murphy-Oates, and satire from Michael Hing and Mark Humphries. It's a global outlook 
with a focus. (An SBS Production)   

 
11:05 pm The World Game - Join the SBS football team for highlights and previews, plus the best 

action, news and exclusive interviews from around the football world. (An SBS Production) 
(Football/Soccer) CC   

 
11:35 pm Anno 1790 – Blind Hand Of Fate – A number of children are found dead in piles of 

rubbish that line Stockholm's shoreline. The investigation leads to the Great Orphanage, 
who claims to know nothing about the bodies. (S.1 Ep.7)(From Sweden in 
Swedish)(Drama Series) M(A,V) 

 
12:40 am Anno 1790 – Die is Cast - A landowner is found dead in the stables of his estate, kicked 

to death by his horse. After it'd determined that the accident is actually a murder, a 
number of people with grudges against the victim are found. (S.1 Ep.8)(From Sweden, in 
Swedish) (Drama Series) M(A,V)  

1:50 am The Legacy - Signe prepares for a possible trial against her siblings, but she's missing a 
key piece of evidence. (S.1,Ep.6) (From Denmark, in Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(A,L)   

 
2:50 am The Legacy - From the creators of ‘Borgen’ and ‘The Killing’, this series traces the story of 

four adult children, and the secrets and lies that turn their lives upside down when their 
wealthy mother - a progressive artist - dies. This episode, Frederik goes to trial against his 
half-sister, causing several family secrets to be revealed. (S.1,Ep.7) (From Denmark, in 
Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(A,L) CC   

  
3:55 am The Legacy - The Grønnegaards move out of the family home. Frederik shares a great 

confession, and his daughter Hannah discovers Solveig and Emil's secret. (S.1,Ep.8) 
(From Denmark, in Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(S,A) CC    
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Tuesday March 28th, 2017      
 

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Judy Woodruff for 

the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Hayley Westenra Live From New Zealand - Hayley Westenra performs with the 

Auckland Philharmonia Orchestra. The performance includes renditions of classics such 
as Bach's Ave Maria, Amazing Grace. Joni Mitchell's Both Sides Now and Claude-Michel 
Schonberg's I Dreamed a Dream. (From New Zealand) (Music Concert) (2005) G   

 
3:25 pm SBS Flashback - Flashback on Tales from a Suitcase – Karima Haroon is an 

exuberant young woman from Afghanistan who arrived in Australia in 1999 as a refugee. 
Tragic circumstances have forced her to take charge and care of her entire family. (An 
SBS Production) (From Australia) (Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:35 pm Into The Universe With Stephen Hawking - Time Travel - The promise of time travel 

has long been one of the world's favourite scientific 'what-ifs?'. With the aid of stunning 
CGI, Stephen Hawking explores all the possibilities, warping the very fabric of time and 
space as he goes. From killing your grandfather to riding a black hole, we learn the pitfalls 
and the prospects for a technology that could quite literally, change everything we have 
ever known. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Part 2 of 4) (Rpt) G CC   
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4:30 pm Wild Britain - January To March - The range of seasons in Britain are as extraordinary 

as the climate is unique. The splendour of the autumn colour change is as magnificent as 
anywhere on earth, while the animal migration is of planet-wide importance. Beautiful 
time-lapse photography illustrates how the landscape is changing minute by minute, day 
by day, month by month – from a waterfall freezing solid to an entire hillside of heather 
bursting with colour. This enchanting series that reveals why Britain’s climate is so unique 
and why the country’s relationship with its wildlife is so enduring and so special. (Part 1 of 
4) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Food Safari Fire - This episode, Maeve learns about a unique range of pots and pans, 

including, the Spanish perol, Croatian peka, Chinese claypot, Moroccan tajine and 
Lebanese saj. First up, Maeve catches up with chef Frank Camorra and his family as they 
cook traditional Spanish dishes, including a show-stopping seafood, meat and rice dish 
cooked in a perol, or a deep dish paella pan. Maeve then shares a classic octopus peka 
with Sydney-based Croatian cook Frank Roncevic, before trying a claypot chicken rice 
with Malaysian born chef Cheong Liew. (S.1,Ep.7) (Commissioned by SBS) (Food Series) 
(Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:30 pm Great Continental Railway Journeys - Riga To Tampere - Michael Portillo ventures to 

the northernmost reaches of Europe where he braves the freezing temperatures of the 
Baltic Sea and finds peace paddling a canoe on the Lakes of Finland. On his journey from 
the Latvian capital, Riga, to Tampere, Finland, Michael encounters medieval knights in 
Tallinn, grills sausages in Helsinki and samples cloudberry liqueur in a hot tub by the light 
of Finland's midnight sun. (S.5, Ep.5) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) G CC **New 
Episode** 

 
8:30 pm Insight - There are thousands of family-run businesses in Australia, and they can put 

tremendous pressure on a tight knit group. Insight is joined by families who have been 
through the highs and lows. (An SBS Production) CC   

 
9:30 pm Dateline - Dateline is an award-winning international documentary series with a current 

affairs backbone. Every week, Dateline transports you to a different part of the world to 
share half-hour stories about family, social injustice, tragedy, redemption and survival. 
Dateline journalists scour the world for the special characters to bring you a world of 
daring stories. (An SBS Production) CC   

 
10:00 pm How Rolls Royce Bribed The World - Rolls Royce has grown dramatically in the past 

twenty years and has won business in some of the most corrupt countries on the planet. 
Richard Bilton investigates the secret network of shady middlemen who helped sell Rolls 
Royce products overseas and uncovers evidence that suggests Britain's most prestigious 
company has bribed its way around the world. (Documentary) (From the UK) (Class. tbc) 
CC **Premiere** 
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10:35 pm The Feed - News. People. Culture. Daily. Your daily mix of news, interviews, in-depth 

features and comedy. Hosted by Marc Fennell and Jan Fran, The Feed brings you the 
stories and perspectives that matter. With reporting from Patrick Abboud and Laura 
Murphy-Oates, and satire from Michael Hing and Mark Humphries. It's a global outlook 
with a focus. (An SBS Production)   

 
11:00 pm Full Frontal With Samantha Bee - Comedian, writer, actress and political commentator 

Samantha Bee brings her sassy, smart and satirical point of view to a range of current and 
relevant issues in her very own late night comedy show. With her signature wit, Samantha 
tackles the taboo topics in a way that no one else can. (From the US) (Entertainment) M   

 
11:30 pm Follow The Money - Mia is approached by a whistle-blower and focuses her energy on 

finding out the truth about Energreen. Sander and Mr. Christensen worry that Mia’s 
findings can jeopardise their listing on the stock exchange, and they plan to stop her with 
Claudia’s help. Mads and Alf follow one of Mia’s leads at Energreen’s research facility in 
Poland. Mads is glad to get away from his chaotic home life. Jan wants to help Nicky and 
Bimse out with the Serbs and introduces them to Erick, their new accountant. (S.1 Ep.5) 
(From Denmark, in Danish) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(S,V,L) CC   

 
12:35 am Follow The Money - Mia is critically injured and in the hospital, but her article on 

Energreen is published and puts Energreen’s management on the spot as they are about 
to go public. The article isn’t Sander’s only problem, since Nicky tries to blackmail him with 
the contents of the stolen iPad. Claudia is troubled by doubt - was Sander involved in 
Mia’s accident? Meanwhile, Mads and Alf are desperately looking for the whistleblower 
who was Mia’s source. (S.1 Ep.6) (From Denmark, in Danish & English) (Drama Series) 
(Rpt) M(V,L) CC   

 
 MOVIE: 
1:40 am Captain Abu Raed - When an old airport janitor finds a captain's hat in the trash, he 

entertains the poor neighbourhood kids in his Jordanian village with fictional tales about 
his life as a pilot. One pragmatic boy, however, refuses to play along. Winner of the 
Audience Award for World Cinema (Dramatic) at the 2008 Sundance Film Festival. 
Directed by Amin Matalqa and stars Nadim Sawalha, Rana Sultan, Hussein Al-Sous. 
(From Jordan, in Arabic, French and English) (Drama) (2008) (Rpt) M(A)   

 
3:35 am One Born Every Minute - It’s the final episode of the series and it’s all hands on deck. 

Perhaps it’s the full moon causing all these women to go into labour, but one thing’s for 
sure - Southmead Hospital is packed to maximum capacity. The women are coming in 
thick and fast, including a Mormon couple expecting baby number three and nervous first 
time parents who don’t even know how to change a nappy. The midwives are concerned 
the unit may have to close. (S.5 Ep.20) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) M(A) 
CC   

 
4:30 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, a pair of young indigenous 
women travel the outback to cook at a huge bush carnival; the making of syrupy Lebanese 
baklava from Abla's Pastry; and a samphire (sea-asparagus) dish from Kangaroo Island. 
(An SBS Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC    
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Wednesday March 29th, 2017 
      

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Judy Woodruff for 

the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Who Do They Think They Are?: 10 Years, 100 Shows - Celebrating its 10th birthday 

and 100th episode in August 2015, this one-hour special features TV moments that have 
marked the series. Family favourites such as Patsy Kensit, Davina McCall, Graham 
Norton, JK Rowling, Stephen Fry, and Natasha Kaplinsky, discover stories of heroism and 
happiness, as well as pain and personal tragedy. From workhouse to royal palaces, 
prisons to parliament, brothel to bedlam, the series has found heroes, villains, royalty and 
rogues. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm Dateline - Dateline is an award-winning international documentary series with a current 

affairs backbone. Every week, Dateline transports you to a different part of the world to 
share half-hour stories about family, social injustice, tragedy, redemption and survival. 
Dateline journalists scour the world for the special characters to bring you a world of 
daring stories. (An SBS Production) CC  

 
3:30 pm Insight - There are thousands of family-run businesses in Australia, and they can put 

tremendous pressure on a tight knit group. Insight is joined by families who have been 
through the highs and lows. (An SBS Production) CC  
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4:30 pm Brazil Coastlines - Amazonia - As South Americas largest country and ranked 5th 

largest in the world, Brazil has become a major tourist destination in the last years and is 
under the spotlight ahead of the 2014 Summer Football cup and 2016 Olympics. Beyond 
the clichés this five-part series takes you deep into the country along seventeen coastal 
states to explore the natural beauty and richness of Brazil and meets with its warmhearted 
inhabitants. (From France, in French & Portuguese) (Documentary) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Food Safari Fire - This episode celebrates classic Asian recipes and culinary techniques 

all designed to cook over coals. Maeve explores Vietnamese bun cha, Korean beef ribs, 
Xinjiang lamb skewers, Japanese kushiyaki and Thai gai yang. In Hanoi, the lunch food of 
choice is bun cha - marinated pork cooked over charcoal. Maeve visits mother and son 
team Angie and Dan Hong who share their recipe for this char-grilled Northern 
Vietnamese street food. Next, Darwin-based chef Chung Jae Lee reveals his prized recipe 
for the marinated short ribs known as So Kalbi. (Ep.8) (Commissioned by SBS) (Food 
Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:30 pm Digging For Britain's Secrets - North- Professor Alice Roberts and archaeologist Matt 

Williams present 2014's most outstanding archaeology from the north of Britain. They visit 
a 5000 year old stone temple in the heart if the Neolithic Orkney World Heritage Site, and 
watch the unearthing of a Roman alter dedicated to Jupiter. (S.3 Ep.3) (From the UK) 
(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC **Final Episode** 

 
8:30 pm 24 Hours In Emergency - In this episode, an 81 year old cyclist is treated for a head 

injury after being hit by a car on the same road that his son was knocked over and killed 
by a car. 93 year old Amy comes to A and E after a clothes airer fell on top of her and 
recalls volunteering for ambulance service during the war. Lastly, 78 year old Samuel 
receives treatment after falling over some boxes and landing on his face. (S.8 Ep.16) 
(From the UK) (Documentary series) M(A) CC 

 
9:30 pm The Night Manager - On the island of Mallorca, Roper's life of calm and luxury is 

shattered. Meanwhile, Pine has crossed the bridge into criminality, with no way to turn 
back. In London, Burr and Steadman meet with MI6 in an attempt to throw them off the 
scent.(S.1 Ep.3) (From the UK) M(A,V) CC **New Episode** 

 
10:25 pm The Feed - News. People. Culture. Daily. Your daily mix of news, interviews, in-depth 

features and comedy. Hosted by Marc Fennell and Jan Fran, The Feed brings you the 
stories and perspectives that matter. With reporting from Patrick Abboud and Laura 
Murphy-Oates, and satire from Michael Hing and Mark Humphries. It's a global outlook 
with a focus. (An SBS Production)   
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10:55 pm Dig - Emma Wilson’s Father - Peter delves further into Emma’s  mysterious past, which 

ultimately leads him to uncover an ancient symbol that has been hidden for centuries.  At 
the compound in New Mexico, someone from Debbie's past attempts to rescue her.  
Lynn's life is put in jeopardy. (S.1,Ep.5) (From the US) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V) CC   

 
11:40 pm Dig - Well Of Souls - As Detective Cohen arrests Emma’s suspected killer, Peter makes 

a startling discovery that changes everything. In Croatia, Avram and the red heifer are 
kidnapped by the stranger with a mysterious agenda. In New Mexico, Tad Billingham 
desperately tries to keep Debbie and Josh from exposing his secrets. (S.1,Ep.6) (From the 
US) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(A,V) CC   

 
 MOVIE:  
12:30 am Km 72 - Millionaire Diego Verastegui has been murdered in his home. After the murder, it 

is discovered that somebody has taken a valuable briefcase from his safe deposit box. His 
bodyguard, Dimas arrives at his house to find three suspects: Carlos, the millionaires' son, 
Anna Karina, a sweet girl and Andres, a bohemian magician. They each retell the story of 
the murder with each claiming a very different version of events and culprit of the murder. 
(From Venezuela, in Spanish) (Thriller) (2015) MA 

  
MOVIE: 

2:20 am The Imaginarium Of Doctor Parnassus - A travelling theatre company gives its 
audience much more than they were expecting. (From the UK) (Movie) (Fantasy) (Rpt) PG 
CC   

 
4:30 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, the cultivation of the boab tree 
of the Kimberley; croquembouche with Jean-Francois Perron at Choco Cannelle in 
Sydney; and Sunday lunch with the Basque community. (An SBS Production) (Food 
Series) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Judy Woodruff for 

the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Nadia Comaneci: Gymnast And The Dictator - Nadia Comaneci is a former Romanian 

gymnast, winner of three gold medals at the 1976 Summer Olympics in Montreal. Her life 
was one of sacrifice, hardship, dedication and triumph played against the backdrop of a 
brutal Communist regime in her home country. Based on her own memoir, this 
documentary tells the story of her life from the young girl in Romania who was discovered 
doing cartwheels in her school playground, to the poised young woman who made a break 
for freedom and eventually made a life for herself away from gymnastics. (From France, in 
English & Romanian) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
3:00 pm Living Black - Life On The Inside - Living Black gains rare access to the Alice Springs 

Correctional Centre, where they get a glimpse of the lives of three Aboriginal inmates 
serving time. (An NITV/SBS Production) (Current Affairs) (Class. tbc) CC 
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3:30 pm Russia's Lost Princesses - The World Turned Upside Down - The story of the final 

four years in the lives of Tsar Nicholas II's four daughters - Olga, Tatiana, Maria and 
Anastasia - concluding with their brutal murders in the bloody climax to the Russian 
revolution. Interviews with leading historians, archive footage and dramatic reconstruction 
reveal the real women behind the familiar images of beautiful girls in white dresses. (Part 
2 of 2) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG(S) CC   

 
4:35 pm Air Aces - Wing Walker - Like all the Allied bombers of World War II, the crew of the 

Lancaster ME669 had one of the most dangerous jobs in the Air Force: to dodge deadly 
enemy fire and drop mega-tonnes of high-powered explosives over Nazi Germany. 
Without them, Hitler may have emerged victorious. But the tactic called "total war", a 
controversial strategy that turned cities into legitimate targets, overshadowed their legacy. 
Yet, for the more than one hundred thousand volunteers – half of who would not return - 
there was no other option. (From the US) (Documentary) (Rpt) PG CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Food Safari Fire - Maeve O'Meara explores the ancient art of smoking in cuisines around 

the world, tasting hot smoked salmon and kingfish, West African condiments, flavoursome 
smoked lamb, Irish cold smoked bacon, and Kansas City style ribs. In search of the 
flavour and texture that smoking provides, Maeve heads to the far NSW south coast 
where master smoker Stan Soroka shares a recipe for a delicious and surprisingly easy 
hot-smoked kingfish. Then Nigerian born provedore, Kunle Adesua, uses techniques from 
home to smoke Australian fish with long-burning red gum in his Melbourne smokehouse. 
(S.1,Ep.9) (Commissioned by SBS) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:30 pm Great British Railway Journeys - Bristol To Burnham-On-Sea - Michael enters the foul 

smelling world of Victorian tannery. In Nailsea, he discovers how mountains of bird 
droppings made one of the greatest fortunes of the era for a 19th century entrepreneur. 
Reaching Glastonbury, Michael heads for the mystical Abbey, where Victorian tourists 
flocked to hear stories of King Arthur and the Holy Grail. (S.7 Ep.14) (From the UK) 
(Documentary Series) (Class. Tbc) CC **New Episode** 

 
8:05 pm Luke Nguyen's Greater Mekong - Chef Luke Nguyen continues his culinary journey 

across the Greater Mekong region of Southeast Asia. Travelling in China's Yunnan 
Province, Luke reaches the fabled town of Lijiang where the nightlife reigns and a Naxi 
'aunty' teaches him how to cook a local speciality. Amid curious marketplace spectators, 
Luke catches a fish with his bare hands and puts his skills to the test, cooking a local-style 
barbequed carp for the first time. (Commissioned by SBS, in English and Mandarin) (Food 
Series) (Rpt) G CC   
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8:35 pm Sugar Free Farm - After two weeks of their radical, new diet, the seven celebrity 

farmhands are ready to re-enter the real world, where they'll be challenged by their old 
temptations. Let loose at the village fair, comedian Joe Pasquale is tempted by the call of 
his favourite sweet treats while former Dr Who Peter Davidson must resist a room filled 
with cupcakes. Meanwhile Alison Hammond is surprised to discover that her taste buds 
have adjusted in the absence of sugar. (S.2 Ep.4) (From the UK) (Documentary series) 
(Class. Tbc) CC**Final Episode** 

 
9:30 pm The Principal - Set in a boy’s high school, this four part drama series features AACTA 

award-winning Alex Dimitriades (The Slap, Underbelly) who plays the role of Matt Bashir, 
a former history teacher and Deputy Principal at a prestigious girls’ school, who is 
promoted to Principal of Boxdale Boys High. Boxdale Boys High is a notoriously violent 
and difficult school and Principal Bashir is brought in because of his different and radical 
approach to reform. The sudden change brings him into conflict on all fronts and even 
leaves his personal life exposed. Still, Bashir works overtime to get the local community 
on side, promising change, but just when it seems he is making progress, a student is 
found dead on school grounds. Also starring Aden Young and Mirrah Foulkes. (New 
Series Premiere) (Ep.1) (Commissioned by SBS) (Drama Series) (Rpt) M(V,L) CC   

 
10:30 pm The Feed - News. People. Culture. Daily. Your daily mix of news, interviews, in-depth 

features and comedy. Hosted by Marc Fennell and Jan Fran, The Feed brings you the 
stories and perspectives that matter. With reporting from Patrick Abboud and Laura 
Murphy-Oates, and satire from Michael Hing and Mark Humphries. It's a global outlook 
with a focus. (An SBS Production)   

 
11:00 pm Atlanta – Juneteenth - Van brings Earn to a 'Juneteenth' party at the home of a wealthy 

acquaintance, but he is less than enthusiastic at the 'emancipation' theme or the snobby 
nature of the bi-racial host couple and their guests. Van thinks the event could be a 
stepping stone to a new job, so Earn does his best to play the dutiful husband. All seems 
well enough until Earn is recognised as thug-rapper, paper Boi's manager which creates a 
conflict he can’t ignore. (S.1 Ep.9) (From the US) (Drama Series) M(S,D,L) CC **Encore**   

 
11:30 pm Atlanta – The Jacket – Earn wakes up in a strange house the morning after an out of 

control party, with his jacket and the valuable content in the pocket missing. As he 
retraces his steps, events out of his control knock him off course and make the prospect of 
locating the missing item seem impossible. But there are also bright spots in Earn's day, 
like an unexpected but much needed windfall and a relaxing evening spent with Van and 
Lottie.  (S.1 Ep.10) (From the US) (Drama Series) M(V,L) CC **Encore**   

 
 MOVIE: 
12:00 am The Chef - Jacky thinks his problems have been solved when he scores a unpaid cooking 

job at a luxury restaurant. But the head chef is facing a crisis of his own, when the new 
owner tries to replace him. Stars Jean Reno. (From France, in French) (Movie) (Comedy) 
(2012) (Rpt) M(L)   

 
1:35 am Sex Toys: Frisky Business - Rabbits - Sex toy ideas often come from the most 

unexpected quarter. In this episode the company launches a ‘Design a Sex Toy’ 
competition. It’s a chance for the public to submit their own toy ideas. Previous 
competitions have yielded worldwide best sellers and lot of laughs. This year is no 
exception. Elsewhere, web TV presenter Annabelle produces her very own range of sex 
toys and the returns department is overrun with rabbit vibrators when the company 
launches a used toy ‘amnesty’. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Part 2 of 6) (Rpt) 
MA(S) CC 



Program Guide SBS – Week 13 

 

Thursday March 30th, 2017 

 
2:30 am Sex Toys: Frisky Business - Burlesque- The erotic Fifty Shades of Grey novels 

captured the imagination of men and women worldwide. At the sex toy warehouse, 
demand for bondage gear has gone through the roof. A long-awaited delivery of whips 
and spankers from China finally arrives. But it’s covered in mould. With the company keen 
to capitalise on our passion for bondage, they launch a vintage range based on 50’s pin 
up model Bettie Page. It’s up to the women in the content team to flog the retro gear, so 
writer Jess heads to a tattoo convention in London to try and drum up trade. But will 
shoppers be willing to buy bondage gear in public? (From the UK) (Documentary Series) 
(Rpt) MA(S)   

 
3:25 am Mummies Alive - The Hero of Herculaneum investigates one of the most famous 

disasters in human history: the eruption of Mount Vesuvius in AD 79.  In 1982, 
archaeologists excavating the original beachfront at Herculaneum found 300 mummified 
skeletons, buried under volcanic ash. One was armed to the teeth and laden with gold and 
silver. Contributions from leading experts in Roman history will investigate his fate. (S.1 
Ep.6) (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M CC   

 
4:20 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, a Haigh family tradition of 
chocolate making; Maltese pastizzi making at Gato's Pastizzi; the highest berry farm in 
Tasmania; and three generations gather to celebrate Saint Savvas Day. (An SBS 
Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:50 am Luke Nguyen's Greater Mekong Bitesize - Chef Luke Nguyen continues his culinary 

journey across the Greater Mekong region of Southeast Asia. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Short) (Rpt) G  CC  
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Judy Woodruff for 

the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Kings Seal - Conspiracy, treason, betrayal, rape and murder: Welcome to the Free-

Settler Colony of South Australia. In 1836 King William IV and the British Parliament 
enshrined into law the "Letters Patent”, the founding document that established the state 
of South Australia. Unknown to many people today, the Letters Patent included a unique 
guarantee to protect and legally secure land rights for all of South Australia's Aboriginal 
people and Descendants, giving Aboriginal people the right to occupy and enjoy their land 
for always. This legal right, still enshrined in law today, was in fact the first ever Aboriginal 
land rights secured in Australia's history, rights that have been denied since 1836. (From 
Australia) (Documentary) (Rpt) G CC   

 
3:00 pm The Marngrook Footy Show - Join Grant Hanson, Gilbert McAdam and an all-star guest 

list for an Indigenous view of this season's AFL (An NITV/SBS Production) (Sport) (AFL) 
CC  
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4:30 pm Luke Nguyen's France - Paris - Luke Nguyen’s appetite for food leads him out of Asia 

and into France, the culinary wonderland that shaped his ancestral home, Vietnam. In 
tonight's episode, Luke embarks on a culinary journey through the heart of Paris, 
discovering Parisians’ passion for food, decadence and tradition. Walking the city streets, 
exploring the French capital’s oldest market and cooking with his Vietnamese-French 
cousin Laurent, Luke investigates how France has influenced Vietnam’s food scene. 
Later, Luke creates a fusion steak tartare dish with a traditional Parisian butcher and 
experiences the sweeter side of the city from the rooftop of the Westin with beekeeper 
Nicolas Géant. (S.1,Ep.1) (Commissioned by SBS, in English and French) (Food Series) 
(Rpt) G CC   

 
5:00 pm Luke Nguyen's France - Paris - Luke Nguyen digs deeper into Parisian food culture and 

life. He sets up his kitchen on a friend’s rooftop in order to cook pot-au-feu, the original 
version of the French dish that became Vietnam’s iconic staple, pho. He tries his hand at 
crafting a true French baguette with the help of artisan baker Benjamin Turquier. Luke 
also has the pleasure of cooking a seasonal asparagus dish with French-Italian chef Erik 
Fontanini in the childhood garden of King Louis XVI. (S.1,Ep.2) (Commissioned by SBS, in 
English and French) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
5:30 pm Letters And Numbers - Two contestants pit their linguistic and numerical skills against 

each other and the clock in this entertaining quiz show. Join host Richard Morecroft along 
with maths whiz Lily Serna and wordsmith David Astle. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Entertainment Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
6:00 pm Food Safari Fire - In the series finale, Maeve embraces the ingenuity of the home-made 

barbecue, exploring the remarkably adaptable 44 gallon drum used in the Kimberley as a 
smoker for barramundi and in Jamaica to cook jerk chicken and pork, as well as various 
parts of fridges, wheelie bins and lawnmowers welded into cooking devices. There’s even 
a car boot BBQ, a homemade Cypriot kleftiko oven and a Samoan umu feast. (Final) 
(Commissioned by SBS) (Food Series) (Rpt)G CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:30 pm Great British Railway Journeys - On the last leg of his journey through northwest 

England, Michael Portillo makes a clean sweep in Ashley when he visits Victorian 
suburban villas with multiple chimneys which used to be swept by children. In 
Macclesfield, Michael finds the end of the Silk Road and tries his hand at screen printing. 
Michael Alights at Froghall for Alton Towers where he traces the nineteenth century 
origins of the modern theme park. (S.7 Ep.15 & 16) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) 
(Class. Tbc) **New Double Episode** 

 
 MOVIE: 
8:35 pm Burn After Reading - In this dark sky comedy, a demoted CIA official writes a top secret 

memoir that is discovered by all the wrong people. What follows is a hilarious and sinister 
blend of mystery and stupidity. Directed by the Academy award winning Coen brothers, 
staring George Clooney, Brad Pitt and John Malkovich.(From the US)(Comedy) (2008) 
(Class. Tbc) CC 

 
10:25 pm SBS World News Late Edition - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national 

and international news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS 
Production) CC   
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 MOVIE: 
11:00 pm Concussion - Follows the erotic journey of forty-something Abby, a lesbian housewife 

who becomes a high-end escort to escape her passionless marriage. Her double life 
proves liberating until a woman from her own social circle becomes a client. Winner of the 
Teddy Jury Award at the 2013 Berlin International Film Festival. Directed by Stacie 
Passon and stars Robin Weigert, Maggie Siff and Johnathan Tchaikovsky. (From the US) 
(Drama) (2012) (Rpt) MA(S) CC   

 
12:45 am Sons Of Liberty - The British Royal Army massacres the colonial militia in Lexington.  

The remaining colonials clash again with the Royal Army at Concord, forcing the British to 
retreat to Boston. While both sides prepare for an inevitable war, Sam Adams and John 
Hancock, along with Benjamin Franklin, desperately attempt to convince the rest of the 
representatives in Congress to support their fight for independence. (Part 5 of 6) (From 
the US) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V) CC   

 
1:40 am Sons Of Liberty - When the Royal Army’s General Gage learns of his wife Margaret’s 

affair with Joseph Warren, Gage launches a full-out assault on the colonists at Bunker Hill. 
Sam Adams uses the news of the battle to persuade the rest of the colonies to vote for 
independence just as the British warships begin firing on Manhattan. Now united, the 
colonies prepare to face their enemy, and the Revolutionary War ensues. (Ep.6) (Final) 
(From the US) (Drama Series) (Rpt) MA(V) CC   

  
 MOVIE: 
2:35 am The Girl With The Dragon Tattoo Part 1 - This Emmy Award-winning television drama is 

based on the best-selling Millennium Trilogy. Investigative journalist Mikael Blomkvist has 
been convicted of libelling billionaire industrialist Hans-Erik Wennerström and wants to 
escape the media attention. He is hired by industrial tycoon Henrik Vanger under the 
guise of writing a biography of Henrik and the Vanger family, while really investigating the 
36-year-old disappearance of Henrik's niece Harriet. He teams up with the introverted and 
skilled computer hacker Lisbeth Salander. Stars Noomi Rapace and Michael Nyqvist. 
(From Sweden, in Swedish) (Drama Series) (Part 1 of 2) (Rpt) MA(V,S,L)   

 
4:15 am Food Lovers' Guide To Australia - Maeve O'Meara and Joanna Savill continue to 

explore the best food and produce around. In this episode, mud crabbing in the Gulf of 
Carpentaria; Colefax Chocolates shares the evolution of exquisite chocolate animals; the 
grain that makes the perfect pasta; and the secrets of Persian cuisine. (An SBS 
Production) (Food Series) (Rpt) G CC   

 
4:50 am Luke Nguyen's Greater Mekong Bitesize - Chef Luke Nguyen continues his culinary 

journey across the Greater Mekong region of Southeast Asia. (Commissioned by SBS) 
(Short) (Rpt) G CC    
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5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 
5:30 am NHK World English News - News from Japan's Broadcasting Corporation, NHK, 

delivering the latest in business, technology, health, environmental and world news, in 
English.   

 
6:00 am France 24 English News - International news and current affairs television from Paris, 

offering a French perspective on world events, in English.   
 
6:30 am Deutsche Welle English News - News and analysis of the top international and 

European news and current affairs from Berlin, in English.   
 
7:00 am Al Jazeera English News - News via satellite from Al Jazeera Satellite Network, Qatar, in 

English.   
 
7:30 am Italian News - News via satellite from RAI Rome in Italian, no subtitles.   
 
8:10 am Filipino News - News via satellite from ABS-CBN Manila, in Tagalog, no subtitles.   
 
8:40 am French News - News via satellite from FT2 Paris, in French, no subtitles.   
 
9:30 am Greek News From Cyprus - News via satellite from CyBC Cyprus, in Greek, no subtitles.   
 
10:30 am German News - News via satellite from DW Berlin, in German, no subtitles.   
 
11:00 am Spanish News - News via satellite from RTVE Madrid, in Spanish, no subtitles.   
 
12:00 pm Arabic News - News via satellite from DRTV Dubai, in Arabic, no subtitles.   
 
12:30 pm Turkish News - News via satellite from TRT Turkey, in Turkish, no subtitles.   
 
1:00 pm PBS Newshour - Reviews and analysis of the day's news presented by Judy Woodruff for 

the Public Broadcasting Service (PBS) in the United States.   
 
2:00 pm Small Business Secrets - This week, visit the company bringing the world's first cold-

pressed milk to Australian supermarkets, and explore how a former soldier invented an 
affordable and compact emergency shelter for refugees and disaster victims. Take a walk 
through Fairfield, one of the most multicultural suburbs in Australia, with Fairfield Chamber 
of Commerce President Vince Movizio. (S.2 Ep.6) (Commissioned by SBS) (Documentary 
series) (Class.tbc) (Rpt) CC **Encore** 

 
2:30 pm ISU Figure Skating - Highlights of the ISU Figure Skating Championship. Bringing all the 

best bits of the  2016/17 championship so far. (Sport) (Figure Skating) CC 
 
3:25 pm Genius Of The Ancient World - Confucius - Confucius is considered the first Chinese 

thinker to take a systematic, philosophical approach to the social, political and moral 
challenges of his world.  Born in a chaotic, violent age, he believed that harmony could be 
restored through the example of the sage rulers of history. He was a great innovator and a 
pioneer in education. He died without seeing his goal achieved. But eventually his 
philosophy became the bedrock of Chinese culture. (From the UK) (Documentary Series) 
(Rpt)  G  CC 
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4:30 pm Blood And Gold: The Making Of Spain - Nation - Simon explores Spain’s golden age 

under Philip II through to the Spanish Civil War and dictatorship under Franco, from which 
Spain has emerged as a modern democratic monarchy. (Part 3 of 3) (From the UK) 
(Documentary Series) (Rpt)  TBC CC   

 
5:30 pm The Stuarts - King without a Crown - Leading historian Dr Clare Jackson looks at the 

impact of the Stuarts, Britain’s greatest and longest-ruling royal dynasty, who united 
Scotland, England and Ireland and presided over the creation of Great Britain. Dr Jackson 
shows how the Stuart monarchs helped establish and decide what the state of Great 
Britain would look like and how their impact on the country can still be felt today. The 
second episode looks at Charles I’s failure to understand the inherent religious instabilities 
across the three kingdoms and how these differences in Britain led to civil war and his 
own execution. (Ep.2) (From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) PG(A) CC   

 
6:30 pm SBS World News - Up-to-date reports and analysis of the major national and international 

news stories of the day in Australia's only world news service. (An SBS Production) CC   
 
7:35 pm The Wonder Of Britain - This series celebrates some of the most impressive natural and 

manmade wonders that make Britain great. Julia Bradbury embarks on a stunning 12,000-
mile journey around the country to some of Britain’s most spectacular locations and 
chooses some of the greatest assets she believes Britons should be most proud of. (Ep.4) 
(From the UK) (Documentary Series) (Rpt) G CC 

 
8:30 pm When We Rise -  In the face of California's Proposition 8 stripping away the rights of the 

LGBTQI community to marry, a newly energised Cleve inspires a younger generation to 
organize a march on Washington to demand full, federal LGBTQI equality in all matters. 
Meanwhile Roma uses her lessons learned as a women and LGBTQI activist to fight for 
healthcare in San Francisco. Ken is struggling to reconcile his sexual orientation with his 
love of God, so recruits an old friend to help fund a meal program for an LGBTQI-inclusive 
church. (Part 4 of 4) (From the US)(Drama Series) (Class. Tbc) CC **Final Episode** 
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EASTERN STATES (NSW, ACT, VIC, TAS) 

 
10:05 pm Live Premier League - Lucy Zelic and Craig Foster host live coverage of the Premier 

League, as Liverpool take on Everton at Anfield Stadium. (Sport) (Football/Soccer) **Live 
to Eastern States** 

 
12:50 am Great British Railway Journeys - Great Yarmouth To Beccles- Michael discovers the 

grave robbing history of Great Yarmouth, tries his hand at working a Victorian Swing 
Bridge in Reedham and takes to the air to discover how a Victorian rail guidebook helped 
aviators in WWII. (S.3 Ep.1)(From the UK)(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC  

 
1:20 am Great British Railway Journeys - Darsham To Felix - Michael follows the Victorians 

fascination with Britain's own Atlantis to the lost city of Dunwich, meets some gentle giants 
who were crucial to the smooth running of the railways and discovers how the Port of 
Felixstowe grew into the biggest container port in the land. (S.3 Ep.2) (From the UK) 
(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC 

 
1:55 am Food Safari Fire Bitesize - The best bits from the ultimate series about cooking with fire 

across the cuisines of the world. (From Australia) (Commissioned by SBS) (Travel Series) 
(Rpt) G   

 
1:59 am The President Vs The Pirates - The world is watching closely as Somalia continues to 

raise fears of extremism and unending clan warfare. Years of civil war and crippling 
drought have torn this once-prosperous nation to shreds. Now pirates and terrorists are 
destroying what remains of civil society. But one man thinks he can make a difference. 
This film gains unprecedented access to Abdirahman Farole, a Somali-Australian former 
refugee who has returned to his native land to become the President of Puntland (the 
northern province of Somalia) with the sole mission to bring back peace and a working 
democracy to Somalia once and for all. (From Australia, in English and Somali) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC   

 
**Daylight Savings Slot for Eastern States and SA**  

2:00 am Ebola - The Search For A Cure - The current Ebola epidemic in West Africa is the worst 
outbreak of the fatal disease in history, with the World Health Organization reporting more 
than 5,800 cases, including more than 3,000 deaths in the current outbreak. The Centers 
for Disease Control and Prevention also assumes that the actual number of cases is 2.5 
times higher than what is officially known and have also predicted 1.4-million infections in 
those countries by January 20 if no action is taken to curb the epidemic in West Africa. In 
this documentary premiere, meet the scientists and doctors from all around the world 
looking for the cure and hear first-hand accounts of what it's actually like to catch - and 
survive - this terrible disease. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC   
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SOUTH AUSTRALIA 

 
10:05 pm Great British Railway Journeys - Great Yarmouth To Beccles- Michael discovers the 

grave robbing history of Great Yarmouth, tries his hand at working a Victorian Swing 
Bridge in Reedham and takes to the air to discover how a Victorian rail guidebook helped 
aviators in WWII. (S.3 Ep.1)(From the UK)(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC  

 
10:40 pm Great British Railway Journeys - Darsham To Felix - Michael follows the Victorians 

fascination with Britain's own Atlantis to the lost city of Dunwich, meets some gentle giants 
who were crucial to the smooth running of the railways and discovers how the Port of 
Felixstowe grew into the biggest container port in the land. (S.3 Ep.2) (From the UK) 
(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC 

 
 MOVIE: 
11:15 pm Warriors of the Rainbow: Seediq Bale - Wei Te-sheng's epic film retells an episode of 

Taiwanese history not known to many. Between 1895 and 1945 Taiwan was a Japanese 
colony, but small groups of the original aboriginal tribes remained scattered around the 
island. In 1930 Mouna Rudo, the leader of the Seediq tribe, settled around Mount Chilai, 
forged a coalition with other Seediq tribal leaders and plotted a rebellion against their 
Japanese colonial masters. Their battle would be initially successful, but how could they 
match the Japanese military aircraft and poison gas? (From Japan, in Seediq & Japanese) 
(Movie) (Rpt) MA(A,V)  

 
1:59 am The President Vs The Pirates - The world is watching closely as Somalia continues to 

raise fears of extremism and unending clan warfare. Years of civil war and crippling 
drought have torn this once-prosperous nation to shreds. Now pirates and terrorists are 
destroying what remains of civil society. But one man thinks he can make a difference. 
This film gains unprecedented access to Abdirahman Farole, a Somali-Australian former 
refugee who has returned to his native land to become the President of Puntland (the 
northern province of Somalia) with the sole mission to bring back peace and a working 
democracy to Somalia once and for all. (From Australia, in English and Somali) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC   

   
**Daylight Savings Slot for Eastern States and SA**  

2:00 am Ebola - The Search For A Cure - The current Ebola epidemic in West Africa is the worst 
outbreak of the fatal disease in history, with the World Health Organization reporting more 
than 5,800 cases, including more than 3,000 deaths in the current outbreak. The Centers 
for Disease Control and Prevention also assumes that the actual number of cases is 2.5 
times higher than what is officially known and have also predicted 1.4-million infections in 
those countries by January 20 if no action is taken to curb the epidemic in West Africa. In 
this documentary premiere, meet the scientists and doctors from all around the world 
looking for the cure and hear first-hand accounts of what it's actually like to catch - and 
survive - this terrible disease. (From the UK) (Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC   
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QUEENSLAND; NORTHERN TERRITORY;  

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 
10:05 pm Great British Railway Journeys - Great Yarmouth To Beccles- Michael discovers the 

grave robbing history of Great Yarmouth, tries his hand at working a Victorian Swing 
Bridge in Reedham and takes to the air to discover how a Victorian rail guidebook helped 
aviators in WWII. (S.3 Ep.1)(From the UK)(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC  

 
10:40 pm Great British Railway Journeys - Darsham To Felix - Michael follows the Victorians 

fascination with Britain's own Atlantis to the lost city of Dunwich, meets some gentle giants 
who were crucial to the smooth running of the railways and discovers how the Port of 
Felixstowe grew into the biggest container port in the land. (S.3 Ep.2) (From the UK) 
(Documentary series) (Class. Tbc) CC 

 
 MOVIE: 
11:15 pm Warriors of the Rainbow: Seediq Bale - Wei Te-sheng's epic film retells an episode of 

Taiwanese history not known to many. Between 1895 and 1945 Taiwan was a Japanese 
colony, but small groups of the original aboriginal tribes remained scattered around the 
island. In 1930 Mouna Rudo, the leader of the Seediq tribe, settled around Mount Chilai, 
forged a coalition with other Seediq tribal leaders and plotted a rebellion against their 
Japanese colonial masters. Their battle would be initially successful, but how could they 
match the Japanese military aircraft and poison gas? (From Japan, in Seediq & Japanese) 
(Movie) (Rpt) MA(A,V)  

 
1:59 am The President Vs The Pirates - The world is watching closely as Somalia continues to 

raise fears of extremism and unending clan warfare. Years of civil war and crippling 
drought have torn this once-prosperous nation to shreds. Now pirates and terrorists are 
destroying what remains of civil society. But one man thinks he can make a difference. 
This film gains unprecedented access to Abdirahman Farole, a Somali-Australian former 
refugee who has returned to his native land to become the President of Puntland (the 
northern province of Somalia) with the sole mission to bring back peace and a working 
democracy to Somalia once and for all. (From Australia, in English and Somali) 
(Documentary) (Rpt) M(A) CC   
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ALL MARKETS REJOIN 

  
 MOVIE: 

3:00 am Phobia - Four of the best directors of Thai horror films each tell a very different kind of 
ghost story - from online predators to violent ghosts bent on revenge and a mummy with 
an axe to grind. Nominated for Best Film at the 2009 Thailand National Film Association 
Awards. Directed by Banjong Pisanthanakun, Paween Purikitpanya, Yongyoot 
Thongkongtoon and Parkpoom Wongpoom, and stars Maneerat Kham-uan, Witawat 
Singlampong and Apinya Sakuljaroensuk. (From Thailand, in Thai and English)  (Horror) 
(2008) (Rpt) MA(H,V)  

 

 
 
 
 

Sunday April 2nd, 2017 
  

5:00 am CCTV English News - The English language news channel from China Central Television 
(CCTV) in Beijing, the nation's largest national broadcasting network.   

 


